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Foreword for  
the new Africa Strategy

Not only Spain and Africa, but also Africa and 
Europe, form part of the same geopolitical 
space, with common challenges requiring 
joint responses and opportunities that can 
only be truly maximized if we work hand in 
hand with our African partners. With am-
bition, our goals will be attainable; without 
ambition, impossible. For Spain, the Euro-
pean country closest to Africa, the present 
and future of the continent, its progress 
towards inclusive and sustainable develop-
ment, its peace and security, are all essential 
goals. 

It is this understanding that inspired the 
preparation of a new strategy for Africa, pre-
sented at the Council of Ministers’ meeting 
of 17 September under the title “Spain-Afri-
ca 2025-2028. Working together through a 
strategic relationship”. 

Defining a new strategy for our action with 
Africa has been a collaborative effort, laun-
ched at the beginning of 2024 with a con-
sultation period lasting several months and 

involving a number of ministries as well as 
civil society, businesses, academia and think 
tanks, both in Spain and in Africa. This dia-
logue was fostered in Madrid and at our em-
bassies in Africa, and during the visits I have 
made to numerous African countries over the 
past year.

The Strategy, which will guide Spanish fore-
ign policy regarding Africa over the coming 
years, proposes 100 lines of action grouped 
under five strategic goals: to strengthen a 
relationship that facilitates joint action; to 
grow towards sustainable development in 
Africa, focused on youth; to connect the so-
cieties and economies of Africa, Spain and 
the rest of the world; to protect, ensuring se-
curity in Africa; and to live together in open 
societies with robust and inclusive institu-
tions.

Combining ambition with realism, these 
measures will boost and expand political dia-
logue, development cooperation, trade rela-
tions and Spanish investment, and include 
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the creation of an Africa advisory committee 
at the Ministry of Foreign Affairs, European 
Union and Cooperation; the strengthening of 
our diplomatic deployment on the ground; 
and the establishment of a new foundation 
for Africa aimed at fostering relations and 
the development of African talent. 

This Strategy takes into account the subs-
tantial changes that have occurred in recent 
years, both on the continent and in the bro-
ader international context. For the first time, 
our strategic approach to Africa is not limi-
ted to Sub-Saharan Africa but instead has a 
continental scope, paying special attention 
to our immediate neighbours, North Africa 
and West Africa.

Today there are 1.25 billion people living in 
Africa. By 2050 there will be 2.5 billion. By 
that same year, almost half of all people un-
der the age of 18 will be African. More than 
450 million Africans are living in poverty, 

and the continent is faced with the challenge 
of creating new jobs for its growing popula-
tion, at a rate of 30 million per year. At the 
same time, according to World Bank projec-
tions, Africa’s contribution to global GDP, 
which today stands at 3%, will be six times 
greater by 2050.  

The Spanish people need to be aware that, 
to a very large extent, the future of Europe, 
and that of Spain in particular, is at stake 
in Africa. This strategy, which is above all a 
national strategy, lays the foundations for a 
revitalized partnership between Spain and 
Africa that seeks to be comprehensive and 
inclusive, leaving no one behind. It is time 
for us to act together with all the resources 
at our disposal. 

José Manuel Albares 
Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union 
and Cooperation
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Executive Summary

The new Spain-Africa Strategy seeks to guide 
Spain’s activities on the African continent. 
This is a strategic necessity, given Spain’s 
location and the various current tendencies 
in Africa. It extends to the whole continent, 
rather than being restricted to Sub-Saharan 
Africa, like the preceding Plan Africas. 

The continental scope of this document is 
coherent with the decision to focus the ma-
jority of its proposed activities on the portion 
of Africa that is closest to Spain, comprising 
West Africa and North Africa, as these su-
bregions are critical to Spain’s economy, se-
curity and stability.

The other distinguishing feature of this 
Strategy is that it sets out how Spain, as a 
Member State of the European Union (EU), 
is equipped to play a more prominent role 
in guiding and implementing EU policy with 
respect to Africa, and to make greater use 
of the instruments offered by that policy to 

support development on the continent, as 
well as a number of strategic goals agreed 
with our African partners.

During preparation of this Strategy, consul-
tations were conducted with numerous sec-
tors by the Minister for Foreign Affairs, Eu-
ropean Union and Cooperation, by the State 
Secretary for Foreign and Global Affairs and 
by the Ambassador-at-Large for Plan Afri-
ca. As part of the consultation process, the 
Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union 
and Cooperation travelled to Senegal, The 
Gambia and Cabo Verde and the State Se-
cretary visited Nigeria, Ghana, Côte d'Ivoire, 
South Africa, Mozambique, Mauritania, 
Egypt, Mali and Ethiopia. During the visits, 
they heard the opinions and concerns of go-
vernments, of African and Spanish firms, of 
civil society organizations and of African and 
Spanish think tanks. 

1
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The Minister of Foreign Affairs, European Union and Cooperation speaking at the African Union Summit held in 
Ethiopia in February 2023.

During the consultation process, the Minis-
ter also hosted his counterparts from Ghana 
and Mozambique. The State Secretary welco-
med his counterparts from Namibia, Senegal 
and The Gambia and held meetings with the 
African Union (AU) and the Economic Com-
munity of West African States (ECOWAS). 
Both the Minister and the State Secretary 
participated in the meetings of the Africa 
Round Table and conversed with experts on 
specific aspects of the African agenda, par-
ticularly with regard to West Africa and the 
Sahel. In addition, the Directorate-General 
for Africa received input from other minis-
tries and from other departments within the 
Ministry of Foreign Affairs, European Union 
and Cooperation (hereinafter, the Foreign 
Ministry) and from Spain’s embassies in 
Africa.

The Strategy is based on an analysis identi-
fying a number of opportunities: the rising 
global profile of Africa in a more competitive 
international environment and its aspiration 
to take on a central role; the priority atta-
ched by the EU to its relationship with Africa; 
the transition on which Africa is embarking 
towards a more productive, diversified, digi-
tal and integrated economy with more green 
energy; the impulse from African youth and 
women in economic and political change; 
the increasing support for democracy; and 
the possibilities offered by mobility and by 
safe, orderly and regular migration for cou-
ntries of emigration and immigration, in 
Africa and Europe.

The challenges that the Strategy highlights 
are: the obstacles to sustainable develop-
ment; costly access to external financing; 
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deficiencies in terms of energy and connec-
tivity; the lack of security owing to conflicts, 
terrorism and organized crime; democracies 
being undermined by difficulties in ensuring 
prosperity and security for citizens; the im-
pact of climate change; and irregular migra-
tory flows.

The Strategy then outlines the assets that 
Spain possesses, as the European country 
closest to Africa, with increasing political 
dialogue with AU and ECOWAS; as a partner 
in trade, investment, development coopera-
tion, security and migration management; 
as a leader in the transport, energy infras-
tructure and fisheries sectors (with the lar-
gest fishing fleet in the EU); and as a coun-
try represented in several African countries 
through cultural and educational coopera-
tion instruments and programmes to pro-
mote the Spanish language.

Spain’s approach to Africa is based on the 
principle of partnership, mutual respect and 
benefit and listening to partners’ needs and 
aspirations, with an emphasis on multilate-
ralism.

The Strategy sets out five strategic goals: (i) 
a relationship between Spain and Africa that 
builds on and expands knowledge and dialo-
gue, facilitating joint activities (“strengthe-
ning”); (ii) involvement in the inclusive sus-
tainable development of Africa by Spanish, 
EU and international institutions, firms and 
organizations, but above all by young people 
(“growing”); (iii) closer ties between the so-
cieties and economies of Africa, Spain and 
the world (“connecting”); (iv) cooperate to 
strengthen capacities in justice and security 
(“protecting”); and (v) open African socie-
ties with robust, inclusive institutions (“li-
ving together”).

These goals are broken down into 100 lines 
of action, listed in the Appendix to this Stra-
tegy, including: 

•	 Strengthening dialogue with African 
countries and organizations; exten-
ding political consultations to a greater 
number of African countries; stren-
gthening Casa África, Casa Árabe and 
Casa Mediterráneo; expanding Spain’s 
diplomatic, cooperation and education 
network in Africa. 

•	 Launching initiatives such as Alianza 
África Avanza to offer institutional sup-
port for Spanish investment.

•	 Taking advantage of the investment op-
portunities for projects in Africa offered 
by the Global Gateway strategy. 

•	 Supporting the reform of the interna-
tional financial architecture to improve 
Africa’s participation in and access to 
financing.

•	 Strengthening relations between Spain’s 
embassies and Delegations of the Eu-
ropean Union and among EU Member 
States with representations in the coun-
tries; monitoring implementation of EU 
instruments.

•	 Launching new higher education and 
vocational training programmes for 
young people in Africa and increasing 
related grants.

•	 Expanding mobility and circular migra-
tion programmes to countries in West 
Africa and the Maghreb.

•	 Strengthening Spanish cooperation with 
Africa in the area of security.

•	 Building relations with the African dias-
pora and combating racism and xeno-
phobia. 

•	 Establishing an advisory committee on 
Africa within the Foreign Ministry and 
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a foundation for strengthening relations 
between the different African societies 
and Spanish society, focusing on young 
people in particular. 

•	 Creating a monitoring mechanism, 
through the Directorate-General for 
Africa and the network of embassies, 
and also through an inter-ministerial 
committee for Africa, whose operationa-
lization is proposed herein. In addition, 
seeking an external evaluation, in kee-
ping with the experience begun under 
the Third Plan Africa.

The President of the Government with the Director-General of the United Nations Office at Nairobi during the 
President’s official visit to Kenya in October 2022.
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Introduction

Spain is increasingly aware that the present 
and future of Africa—encompassing its pros-
perity, security and progress towards truly 
inclusive and sustainable development—are 
of utmost strategic interest for Spain. This 
pursuit of closer partnerships with Africa is 
also a reflection of the deep-rooted values 
of the Spanish people, as demonstrated by 
their solidarity during humanitarian crises, 
and the ever-closer ties between our civil 
societies, academic and educational institu-
tions, creators and researchers, media and 
foundations. The strengthening of these ties 
is also evidenced by the growing demand in 
Africa for Spanish language lessons and the 
increase in visits to Spain by African autho-
rities and businesspersons.

Africa is important for Spain and is increasin-
gly important in the world, as demonstrated 
by the continent’s growing involvement in 
issues concerning global governance, finan-
cing for development, climate change adap-

tation, reform of multilateral institutions, 
continental and global peace and security, 
and its desire to play a role that is more 
befitting of its population size, its political 
influence and the opportunities it offers. 
These African aspirations are being met by 
other countries and regions with proposals 
and offers, some of which complement those 
made by Spain and the European Union and 
others that compete with them.

Previously, the strategic documents prepa-
red by Spain were restricted to Sub-Saharan 
Africa. There were multiple historical and 
cultural reasons for such a limitation. No-
netheless, the continent’s interdependence 
and political trends warrant a unified ap-
proach, aligned with the drives for integra-
tion within Africa and in keeping with the 
transnational nature of many of the pheno-
mena that are affecting all of the subregions 
of Africa, without exception. This is parti-
cularly true for the areas of Africa nearest to 

2
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Spain, namely North Africa, West Africa and 
the Sahel, which are critical to our country’s 
economy and security, and which require 
more concentrated operational efforts. This 
vast geographical area is unified by the sig-
nificant interdependence between political, 
cultural, economic and human trends in 
these subregions.

One of Spain’s aims as part of this revitali-
zed relationship with African countries is to 
strengthen multilateral coordination in the 
framework of the multiple organizations, 
forums and programmes that address global 
issues. 

As a State with a prominent profile within 
the EU, Spain aspires to play an even more 
important role in guiding and implementing 
EU policy with respect to Africa. The decla-
ration signed in 2022 by the EU and the AU, 

entitled “A Joint Vision for 2030”, sets out a 
road map for the Africa-Europe Partnership 
and defines aspirations. Spain wants to help 
realize those aspirations, drawing on all of 
its capabilities, actively participating in EU 
instruments and initiatives such as the Glo-
bal Gateway strategy and exploring syner-
gies and complementarities through its own 
foreign policy and cooperation initiatives. 
Spain will strive to ensure that the interests 
of African partners are taken into account in 
EU decision-making processes, especially in 
cases that can have a notable impact on their 
societies and economies.

The size of Africa, geographically and de-
mographically, requires a capacity for action 
that exceeds the capabilities of almost any 
individual State. That is why Spain needs 
the EU to be present and stronger in Africa, 
among other reasons because it implements 

Group photo of the Africa Round Table meeting held at the headquarters of the Ministry of Foreign Affairs, Eu-
ropean Union and Cooperation on 22 March 2024.
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several projects using EU funds. Similarly, 
international financing—be it public or pri-
vate—is vital to unlocking the continent’s 
full potential. As a country that is commit-
ted to economic growth and the Sustaina-
ble Development Goals (SDGs), but also as a 
neighbour to Africa and thus a country with 
a special interest in the continent’s stability 
and prosperity, this vision will form part of 
Spain’s position in international forums.

One of the milestones in this regard will be 
the Fourth International Conference on Fi-
nancing for Development, to be held in Se-
ville, Spain, in July 2025. The fact that Spain 
has been chosen to host the Conference is a 
reflection of our commitment to consensus-
building, to being open to dialogue and to 
nurturing ties between the so-called Global 
North and South. 

This Strategy is a collective work and a re-
sult of an extensive process of consultations 
with governments, organizations, firms, 
civil society and think tanks, in both Afri-
ca and Spain. It is a Spanish Strategy, but 
one that aims to align with the assessments, 
goals and aspirations of Africa, which have 
been conveyed through a dialogue between 
equals, based on respect and on finding 
areas of shared interest. 

In order to defend Spain’s national interests 
and promote our country’s values, we must 
support African countries’ and peoples’ pur-
suit of progress, stability, economic growth 
and inclusive sustainable development for 
their continent.

In the analysis of opportunities and challen-
ges and in the proposals for specific activi-
ties, this Strategy aims to do justice to the 
complexity of Africa’s circumstances, which 
are by no means uniform across the conti-
nent, striking a balance between ambition 
and realism. Each subregion of the conti-
nent—North Africa, West Africa, East Africa, 

Central Africa and Southern Africa—has its 
own specific characteristics and trends.

The Strategy examines the opportunities 
offered by: an expanded and stronger rela-
tionship between Spain and the EU, on one 
hand, and Africa, on the other, in a more 
competitive global context; the structural 
transformation on which Africa is embar-
king, towards a more productive and di-
versified economy that is more digital and 
integrated, with more renewable energy; 
the central role of civil society and above 

Construction of the first water network of the Com-
munities of Ribeira Grande de Santiago in Cabo Verde, 
funded by Spanish Cooperation.
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all of African youth in economic and poli-
tical change; the pressing need to continue 
making progress on gender equality; support 
for democracies; Africa’s enormous cultural 
and historical wealth, which is increasingly 
represented at international events by artists 
from the continent; the growing interest 
among the African population in the Spanish 
language, with several African countries 
among those with the highest numbers of 
students of Spanish in the world.

However, the Strategy does not shy away 
from the challenges: obstacles to economic 
development; the large informal economy; 
poverty and inequality; costly access to ex-
ternal financing; deficiencies in energy and 
connectivity; insecurity caused by conflicts, 
increased terrorism and organized crime; 
some democratic governments being under-
mined; the impact of climate change; and 
lastly, irregular migratory flows and people 
smuggling.

Spain has key assets with which to approach 
this context, in the areas of policy, security, 
economics, and social and cultural coopera-
tion, which are the fruit of policy that has 
become increasingly ambitious and strategic 
since the turn of the century. In the strategic 
dimension, however, the partnership with 
Africa requires Spain to do more and to do 
it better, building on what we already have 
and adapting it to ensure that it can res-
pond more effectively to the historic period 
of change occurring at the global level and 
within Africa, working together to stren-
gthen, grow, protect, live together and con-
nect. The new Spain-Africa Strategy aims to 
contribute to achieving this.  
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Opportunities and 
challenges for Africa

Ample 
opportunities… 
Africa is a continent of many opportunities 
for its own population, for the world and 
also for Spain.

The governments and societies of Africa are 
increasingly aware of their rightful place in 
the world and the influence they want to 
have on decisions affecting them, such as 
the transformation of the global order. 

Youth playing a central role 
in the transformation of 
the continent. Commitment 
to democratic values and 
principles

Demographic factors also offer another 
substantial opportunity in terms of econo-

mic growth, progress and development in 
Africa, if proper advantage is taken of them. 
High fertility rates and gradual rises in life 
expectancy, especially as a result of advan-
ces in health care and education, are putting 
the African continent at centre stage of the 
sweeping demographic changes affecting 
our planet.

United Nations projections suggest that by 
2050 the population of Africa will have dou-
bled to 2.5 billion people. Just eight coun-
tries will account for over half of the world’s 
population growth, five of them African: 
Nigeria, Democratic Republic of the Congo, 
Tanzania, Egypt and Ethiopia. Nigeria is on 
course to becoming the third most populous 
country in the world, surpassed only by In-
dia and China. Moreover, by 2050 around 
half of the world’s population of people aged 
under 18 years will be African.

3
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WORLD REGIONS: POPULATION CHANGE (2030-2100)
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Africa is a young continent now (the average 
age is 19 years, compared to 42 in Europe) 
and will be for the remainder of the century. 
Young people will play a central role in the 
transformation of Africa, provided that their 
demand for training, employment, mobili-
ty and civic responsibility is met by African 
States with the support of their international 
partners. 

The demographic bonus—in the form of 
improved productivity resulting from ex-
pansion of the adult population, urbani-
zation and a smaller dependent population 
in relative terms—will be realized provided 
that the right policies are adopted now, es-
pecially concerning quality basic education 
for African children, higher education, voca-
tional training and labour market inclusion 
and decent work for young people. The eco-
nomic and social transformation of Africa 

and its greater integration into global value 
chains call for Africans who are able to lead 
the process and perform work in sectors that 
offer more added value.

The demographic trend on the African con-
tinent contrasts with that of the EU. Accor-
ding to the Statistical Office of the European 
Union (Eurostat), by the middle of the twen-
ty-first century, people aged over 65 years 
will account for 30% of the total EU popu-
lation, twice the percentage of young people 
aged 15–29 years. 

African youth’s attitudes, interests and va-
lues are both the cause and the effect of the 
aforementioned encouraging patterns. They 
have ever more urban and globalized lifes-
tyles, but are increasingly proud of their 
roots and African identity. The younger 
generation is more involved and also more 



19

THE 7 ASPIRATIONS OF 
THE AU AGENDA 2063: 
THE AFRICA WE WANT

Our aspirations for the Africa we want

1 A prosperous Africa based on inclusive 
growth and sustainable development.

2 An integrated continent, politically 
united based on the ideas of Pan 

- Africanism and the vision of Africa´s 
Renaissance.

3 An Africa of good governance, 
democracy, respect for human rights, 

justice and the rule of law.

4 A peaceful  
and secure Africa.

5 An Africa with a strong cultural 
identity, common heritage,  

values and ethics.

6 An Africa, whose development is 
people-driven, relying on the potential 

of African people, especially its women an 
youth, and caring for children.

7 Africa as a strong, united, resilient and 
influential global player and partner.

demanding than preceding generations, and 
does not settle for certain forms of gover-
nance. This generation is more connected 
and able to take advantage of new technolo-
gies. It is at the heart of the boom in African 
universities, scientific institutes and think 
tanks, and of the increased capacity for en-
trepreneurship. African youth are calling for 
more participation by the continent on the 
international stage, and they want to be part 
of its transformation and of major global 
changes and challenges. 

In keeping with the Organisation for Econo-
mic Co-operation and Development (OECD) 
report Africa’s Development Dynamics 
2024, Spain will consider how to increase 
the supply of high-quality skills in Africa by 
supporting the creation of quality jobs and 
entrepreneurship to drive growth and pro-
ductivity, in line with the vision of Agenda 
2063: The Africa We Want and its aspira-
tions.

Population growth in Africa is also leading to 
a rise in the number of people with access to 
education, meaning that an enormous body 
of talent is being cultivated. Support for the 
AU and ECOWAS commitments to better 
education and job prospects for this young 
labour force will be key. Improved access 
to and quality of training that matches job 
opportunities is part of African economies’ 
path towards production transformation.

Higher profile and greater 
influence of Africa and its 
regional organizations

This shared awareness and determination 
of African countries is exemplified by the 
African Union, of which all the States on 
the continent are members. The AU is a fo-
rum for coordination of policy and security, 
with its interlinked African Peace and Secu-
rity Architecture, trade and economic inte-
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gration framework (the African Continental 
Free Trade Area, AfCFTA) and a tool to pro-
mote the shared development of the entire 
continent (the African Union Development 
Agency, AUDA-NEPAD). 

Beyond the continental level, in the multi-
lateral sphere, the 54 African States account 
for 28% of votes in the General Assembly 
of the United Nations and act as an increa-
singly aligned bloc that the rest of the world 
must take into account in responses to glo-
bal challenges. 

The AU recently became a full member of 
G20, which is a transformational step toward 
a single, unified voice of the African conti-
nent being heard within the global gover-
nance mechanism, which already had a key 
stakeholder from the region as a member: 
South Africa. The BRICS group is also ex-
panding in Africa, with the accession in Ja-
nuary 2024 of Egypt and Ethiopia to the new 
BRICS+ group. In this respect, Africa is also 
arguing for a permanent seat on the United 
Nations Security Council.

This new emergence of Africa on the inter-
national stage has been met by fresh interest 
from third countries and regions in incre-
asing their presence and influence on the 
continent, which is rich in strategic resou-
rces and has considerable growth potential.

An ever more fragmented global situation is, 
for many African countries, an opportunity 
to diversify foreign relations and become 
freer in selecting partners and offers, based 
on their needs.

The governments of African countries, ha-
ving listened to the demands of their po-
pulations, have taken on the responsibility 
of shaping their aspirations and aims into 
continental strategies, the exemplar being 
Agenda 2063: The Africa We Want, adopted

PILLAR 1 . Peace, Security and Stability.

PILLAR 2. Governance and Rule of Law.

PILLAR 3. Economic integration and 
Interconnectivity.

PILLAR 4. Transformation, Inclusive and 
Sustainable Development.

PILLAR 5. Social Inclusion.

THE FIVE PILLARS OF 
ECOWAS VISION 2050  
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by the African Union in 2013, with seven key 
shared aspirations.

Subregional organizations have also prepa-
red strategic documents. Given its proximi-
ty to the subregion of West Africa, ECOWAS 
Vision 2050 is particularly important to 
Spain.

Good prospects for economic 
growth  

Several more opportunities stem from 
Africa’s prospects for economic growth and 
development. Although 33 of the 46 coun-
tries classified by the United Nations as de-
veloping economies are in Africa, and even 
though the continent’s GDP represents just 
3% of world GDP, the World Bank forecasts 
that Africa’s contribution will be six times 
larger by 2050.

In addition to this forecast growth—also 
influenced by factors that are external to 

the continent such as demand for commo-
dities, energy resources and agricultural 
products—significantly, over the past two 
decades the African economy has been un-
dergoing a structural transformation as the 
rural population, which until now has ac-
counted for the majority of the population of 
almost all African countries, has been aban-
doning rural work to seek opportunities in 
retail and other services in cities.

However, the industrial sector (also un-
der threat from Asian competition) rema-
ins small in relative terms, so an increase 
in agricultural productivity is still vital to 
Africa—home to almost 60% of the world’s 
uncultivated land—continuing to make 
progress towards food self-sufficiency. In 
2020, the agricultural sector still employed 
half of Africa’s labour, primarily on sma-
llholdings, making little use of technology 
and relying heavily on rainfall.

The majority of Africans have been abandoning the countryside and rural jobs to seek employment in the city. 
The photograph shows the cotton harvest in a village in Burkina Faso.
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Abundant strategic resources 
for sustainable growth, the 
energy transition and the 
digital revolution

With its abundant strategic resources, inclu-
ding minerals that are critical for the energy 
transition and the digital revolution on the 
continent and globally, Africa offers signi-
ficant opportunities for investment from 
abroad. The restructuring of global value 
chains through diversification, friend-sho-
ring and near-shoring, together with the 
growing importance of critical commodities, 
have the potential to drive development of 
regional value chains in Africa, and, given 
the continent’s geographical proximity to 
the EU and particularly to Spain, to integrate 
African countries into European value cha-
ins.

Provided that the challenges originating 
from investors’ heightened risk perceptions 
and lack of confidence are mitigated, greater 
advantage can be taken of opportunities for 
direct investment, which is a key ingredient 
of industrialization and vital to Africa’s out-
put generating more added value and better 
jobs.

The economic transformation and ecologi-
cal transition must take place in parallel and 
drive each other. The different subregions 
of Africa have room to improve use of their 
assets and thus accelerate the production 
transformation sustainably. For example, 
Southern Africa is home to around 60% 
of Africa’s installed solar power capacity, 
while the Great Rift Valley, in East Africa, 
has the most geothermal potential on the 
continent. Africa has the greatest hydroelec-
tric potential on the planet and 50% of re-
newable energy potential, which has barely 
been exploited to date: for example, it is 
home to 60% of solar resources, but just 1% 
of the world’s installed solar capacity.

Electrification of Africa is compatible with 
distributed generation of electricity using 
renewable sources and with self-supply. The 
model for investments in energy infrastruc-
ture in Africa must therefore be an advanced 
one, not that applied before the oil crisis of 
the 1970s. 

In view of its renewable energy poten-
tial, abundant space and water and natu-
ral ports, Africa is well suited to playing a 
central role in the emergence of a new eco-
nomy linked to green hydrogen. The sec-
tor has enormous potential for the countries 
of North Africa. Mauritania, for example, is 
well positioned to become a regional hub of 
green hydrogen production, which is crucial 
to ensuring a stable energy supply and to 
meeting the goal of tripling renewable ener-
gy capacity by 2030. 

The woodland of Central Africa accounts for 
35% of forested land on the continent and 
11% of world carbon reserves in the forest 
biomass. Conservation of the region’s na-
tural ecosystems and biodiversity has clear 
environmental and economic benefits, pro-
vided that ways are found to make sustai-
nable use of the resources, promoting their 
maintenance and making their long-term 
use viable. 

In the African Leaders Nairobi Declaration on 
Climate Change and Call to Action (Nairobi 
Declaration) adopted at the end of the Africa 
Climate Summit in September 2023, African 
countries announced the aim of maintaining 
a common position and their refusal to be 
forced to choose between development aspi-
rations and climate action. The African bloc 
argues that the challenges of climate change 
must be addressed in a coordinated man-
ner and in parallel to the SDGs, and there-
fore advocates measures such as increasing 
financing and establishing mechanisms to 
compensate for loss and damage caused



23

by climate change and to convert debt into 
green investments.

Another aspect that should not be over-
looked is the enormous potential that Africa 
has for development of the blue economy, 
an area in which Spain is one of the leaders 
in Europe. Africa’s blue economy is already 
driving sustainable growth, with 13 million 
square kilometres of exclusive economic zo-
nes in the seas and oceans surrounding the 
continent. 

The sector has not, however, been given due 
consideration. Strategic partnerships and 
innovative investments in Africa's blue eco-
nomy will be vital for generating income and 
creating jobs, improving the local economy, 
eradicating poverty, improving food securi-
ty, and increasing environmental sustaina-
bility in coastal communities.

Economic sectors such as tourism and fis-
heries are directly dependent on the coastal 
environment being clean and healthy. It is 

likely that innovative projects will be carried 
out in these spheres in relation to biotech-
nology, fish farming, food production, re-
cycling and sustainable shipbuilding, all of 
which are of great interest for Spanish firms. 
The sea and maritime natural resources are 
prime sources of economic growth for Afri-
can countries. Following decades of work in 
this area alongside African countries, parti-
cularly those of North Africa, the aim is to 
shape a sustainable model that contributes 
to generating wealth and creating jobs in 
Africa.

Integrating the blue economy into the fra-
mework of the African Continental Free Tra-
de Area Agreement may also drive sustaina-
ble economic growth in coastal countries. In 
short, by consolidating the progress made in 
ecosystem management, Africa can become 
a global leader in conservation of biodiversi-
ty and sustainable development.

Africa’s blue economy is a driver of growth. The photograph shows workers at the Cape Maclear port in Lake 
Malawi National Park, a UNESCO World Heritage site. 
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An emerging middle class 
driving social and political 
change

Buoyant economic growth in many African 
countries since the turn of the century, rapid 
urbanization and improved productivity have 
also facilitated the appearance of an emerging 
middle class, which is driving changes in li-
festyles and consumer behaviour as well as 
social and political change.

One phenomenon that is closely linked to 
the different demographic trends on neigh-
bouring continents such as Africa and Europe 
is international migration. In contrast with 
common perceptions in Europe, the majority 
of migratory movements are between African 
countries. Africans that migrate from coun-
tries in West Africa predominantly do so to 
other countries from the same subregion, 
generally to those along the Gulf of Guinea, 
where there are more job opportunities, and 
to North Africa. Migration is therefore a com-
plex phenomenon, whereby African countries 
are not only places of origin of migrants, but 
also of transit and hosts to them.

African migrants residing in Europe signi-
ficantly benefit both their host country and 
their countries of origin, to which they contri-

bute substantial remittances (in total surpas-
sing the sum of foreign direct investment and 
Official Development Assistance) and valuable 
expertise when they return. There are around 
1.2 million African nationals living in Spain, 
over half of whom are of Moroccan origin.

Improvements to physical 
infrastructure and digital 
connectivity

Improvements to physical infrastructure and 
expansion of digital connectivity promote 
more exchanges among African societies, 
and between African societies and the rest 
of the world, including Spain. Information, 
knowledge, scientific and technical progress, 
goods and services and people all move more 
easily than ever between the two continents. 
Some African societies, particularly in ur-
ban settings, have entered the Digital Age 
without having to complete the stage of 
implementing analogical communications, 
meaning that opportunities for social and 
economic development are accelerating.

Two thirds of Africans prefer democracy to any other form of government.
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Commitment to democratic  
values and principles of the  
population. Robust regional 
organizations

A predominantly young population and ex-
panding urban middle class are behind the 
commitment to democratic values and prin-
ciples among the vast majority of African ci-
tizens, as reflected by surveys such as those 
conducted by Afrobarometer or the Ibrahim 
Index of African Governance. According to 
the survey results, two thirds of Africans 
prefer democracy to any other form of go-
vernment. As in the rest of the world, healthy 
democracy in Africa calls for greater

well-being, freedom and security and socie-
ties that are more inclusive.

Improved basic services—such as electricity, 
drinking water, education, health care, se-
curity and anti-corruption measures—are 
the only means of restoring citizens’ trust in 
public powers in the areas where the social 
compact has been damaged.

The preference for democracy of the majo-
rity of African societies is a result of a con-
tinent-wide movement, whereby the pre-
vious one-party regimes that arose following 
independence gave way, at different points 
in history, to more pluralistic systems of go-
vernment. Periodic elections being held 

MOST CRITICAL 
ASPIRATIONS 
ACCORDING TO THE 2023 
MO IBRAHIM

28,8%

25,0%22,5%

15,0%

3,8%
3,8% 1,3%

Which on the African Union´s Agenda 2063´s 
aspirations is most critical to you at this stage?

ASPIRATION 3. An Africa of good governance, 
democracy, respect for human rights, justice 
and the rule of law

ASPIRATION 1. A prosperous Africa based on 
inclusive growth and sustainable development.

ASPIRATION 6. An Africa, whose development 
is people-driven, relying on the potential of 
African people, especially its women an youth, 
and caring for children. 
 
ASPIRATION 7. Africa as a strong, united, 
resilient and influential global player and 
partner. 

ASPIRATION 2. An integrated continent, 
politically united based on the ideas of 
Pan - Africanism and the vision of Africa´s 
Renaissance.

ASPIRATION 4. A peaceful and secure Africa.

ASPIRATION 5. An Africa with a strong 
cultural identity, common heritage, shared 
values and ethics.
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became the norm, even though they were 
often contested and sometimes led to severe 
crises or even violent civil conflicts.

Contributions were made to the reaffir-
mation of democratic principles by the AU 
and other regional organizations from the 
continent, which have recognized in their 
founding documents the desire of Africans to 
participate freely in the decisions that affect 
their futures through genuinely democratic 
institutions, and which defend those aspira-
tions through their policy measures.

For Spain and the European Union—whose 
external action has the aim of promoting de-
mocracy—the democratic aspirations of lar-
ge swathes of African societies are a powerful 
incentive and a source of cooperation oppor-
tunities.

The aforementioned opportunities in the di-
plomatic, economic, demographic, environ-
mental, technological, social, cultural and 
institutional spheres exist at a time when 
the EU has resolved to structure its relations 

with Africa around the concept of partner-
ship and around pragmatism, as Spain has 
been advocating for many years.

This thinking is based on recognition of 
the need to pinpoint shared opportunities 
through ongoing open dialogue, opportuni-
ties which, if realized, will generate prospe-
rity for all stakeholders. The processes of po-
litical and economic integration on the two 
continents, with their specific characteristics, 
magnify the potential benefits of partnership. 

... and veritable 
challenges
The range of opportunities described in the 
preceding section should not distract from 
the challenges, both long-standing and new, 
which jeopardize the African continent’s goals 
of prosperity, peace, involvement at the glo-
bal level and sustainable development. These 
factors are also challenges with regard to the 
partnership between Spain (and the EU) and 
Africa. According to the AU, although progress 
has been made on the seven aspirations set 
out in Agenda 2063, just one—political inte-
gration—is considered to be closer to being 
achieved.

Incomplete political and 
economic integration

On the issue of political and economic in-
tegration of Africa, there are differences 
within the AU and subregional organiza-
tions such as ECOWAS. The evident interre-
latedness of the different African subregions 
is not always supported by effective insti-
tutional frameworks. In addition, AfCFTA, 
which has been in place since 2019, has yet 
to become a reality on the ground, through 
fulfilment of all of the intended stages of 
trade liberalization.

The Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union and 
Cooperation during the signing of the Memorandum 
of Understanding on Political Dialogue and Sectoral 
Collaboration, at Madrid in May 2022.
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Discrimination on the basis of 
gender 

Discriminatory social norms and prejudices 
linked to women’s access to training and fi-
nancing are an enormous obstacle for the en-
trepreneurial spirit of African women and for 
their access to the formal job market. Most of 
these women are obliged to participate in the 
informal economy, which is characterized by 
instability and irregular income.

Although African women represent 50% 
of the African population, they account for 
only 33% of the continent’s GDP. The vast 
majority of African women are self-emplo-
yed—90% of working women are self-em-
ployed in some African countries. There are 
countries where fewer than 1 out of every 10 
women has access to loans or financing from 
financial institutions. Women even encou-
nter difficulties in opening bank accounts. 
Another barrier faced by the majority of wo-
men is a lack of access to land. 

In many African countries, gender-based 
violence is another scourge that has proved 
difficult to eradicate and which has yet to be 
recognized as a social issue, but rather as a 
marital or family problem, which must be 
resolved within that sphere. Women’s access 
to justice in cases of gender violence rema-
ins limited owing, among other factors, to 
family and social pressure and to a lack of 
access to resources and to legal information.

Female genital mutilation—despite genera-
lly being unlawful and despite the progress 
made—continues to be practised across Afri-
ca. According to the World Health Organiza-
tion (WHO), this practice affects more than 
200 million women and girls in the world 
and more than 140 million in Africa. Accor-
ding to the United Nations Children’s Fund 
(UNICEF), each year in Africa 3 million wo-
men and girls are at risk of being mutilated.

Insufficient access to financing 

Africa’s increasingly powerful voice on the 
international stage has not been enough to 
make international financial institutions 
more representative or to obtain more fa-
vourable financing terms for the continent. 
Twenty low-income African countries are 
currently in debt distress. The average debt 
ratio of African countries has doubled over 
the last decade (“African Debt”, ONE Data 
& Analysis).

From Africa’s perspective, a global inno-
vative ecosystem is needed to promote de-
velopment, driving fairer and more sustai-
nable international financial flows, while 
preserving the fiscal sovereignty of deve-
loping countries, to enable them to adopt 
the policies that are best suited to their cir-
cumstances. 

Remittances from the African diaspora are 
an important source of financing for the 
continent. Despite this, it is considerably 
more expensive to send remittances to 
Africa than to other regions, thereby res-
tricting the vast transformational potential 
of these transfers. Lower remittance fees 
and measures to facilitate investments by 
the African diaspora would support local 
production instead of fuelling consump-
tion-based rentier economies.

Many African economies still depend on 
a small set of export products, primarily 
commodities; this explains the marginali-
zation of Africa in the global economy and 
its limited contribution to trade exchanges 
(just 2.9%) and value chains. 
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Inadequate transport, 
communications and electricity 
infrastructure

The aforementioned situation is partly a re-
sult of inadequate transport, communica-
tions and electricity generation and distri-
bution infrastructure, which severely limits 
the capacity to transform economies. Africa 
is suffering from a pressing shortage of con-
nectivity, in physical terms but also in terms 
of services, data and information. The Afri-
can Development Bank has highlighted that 
investments in infrastructure in Africa have 
not matched the pace of growth in demand: 
less than 40% of the African population 
has access to electricity, just one third of 
the rural population has access to roads and 
a mere 5% of farming employs irrigation. 
While Africa occupies 23% of the surface 
area of the planet, its rail network accounts 
for just 7% of the world total.  

Structural imbalances that 
have worsened in the wake of 
the Covid-19 pandemic and the 
Russian invasion of Ukraine

Over the first two decades of the twenty-first 
century, Africa recorded sustained economic 
growth—at around 4.5% a year according to 
World Bank data—owing to favourable en-
vironments, both external (high commodity 
prices) and internal (greater macroeconomic 
stability).

However, the Covid-19 pandemic and the 
repercussions of the Russian invasion of 
Ukraine brought the upward trend to an end 
and cast light on structural imbalances, in 
the form of limited diversification, overde-
pendence on exports of natural resources 
and ores and ballooning external debt, ag-
gravated by a new cycle of interest rate hikes 
that hampered debt service.

In 2023, the continent’s GDP growth retur-
ned to pre-pandemic levels, with the second 
highest rate in the world, surpassed only 

The Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union and Cooperation during his visit in 2023 to the village of Gan-
guel, Niger, where Spanish Cooperation works to improve the food security of the local communities.
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by Asia. Even so, Africa is still afflicted by 
a lack of production transformation, which 
would lead to extensive job creation and in-
tegration of the continent into global value 
chains.

One of the foremost economic challenges 
that African States face is ensuring that the 
economic growth of recent years results in 
creation of quality jobs and sufficient live-
lihoods for the majority of the population. 
Therefore, the different countries must 
adopt strategies, policies and programmes 
that favour creation of quality jobs.

In addition, despite economic growth, in-
creases in life expectancy and reductions in 
infant mortality, population growth and high 
levels of inequality have limited the benefits 
in terms of improved living conditions for 
Africans. In the 30 years from 1990 to 2019, 
while annual per capita GDP growth for In-
dia and China averaged 5% and 8% respecti-
vely, the figure for Africa was just 1%.

Poverty levels continue to rise

At the same time, over 450 million Africans 
are living in poverty. In the Sub-Saharan 
subregion, the percentage of the population 
living in extreme poverty is even higher, 
at 40% (United Nations Development Pro-
gramme, UNDP). Furthermore, urbanization 
puts further pressure on the environment 
and on administrations, magnifying cha-
llenges in areas such as water supply, waste 
management and disaster prevention.

The African States are aware that economic 
growth must be sustainable and fair and that 
attention must be paid to the most vulne-
rable. The concept of the social and solida-
rity economy (SSE) has gained traction as a 
powerful guiding criterion at the global le-
vel, and five African countries (Cabo Verde, 
Cameroon, Djibouti, Tunisia and Senegal) 
have already passed laws in this area. Other 
countries, such as Morocco, are working on 
legislation.

TRANSPORT INFRASTRUCTURE  
IN AFRICA AND OTHER COUNTRIES AND REGIONS
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Africa, the most vulnerable  
continent to the effects of the 
climate crisis

Africa is the continent that contributes the 
least to the climate crisis (just 2.5% of global 
emissions of greenhouse gases) but it is also 
the most vulnerable to its devastating effects. 
Indeed, 35 of the 50 countries most exposed 
to the effects of climate change are located 
in Africa. If climate change continues at its 
current pace—a pace that is faster in Afri-
ca—output from farming (which currently 
employs over 40% of the economically active 
population in Africa) will decline by around 
3% by 2030 and by around 18% by 2050, ac-
cording to projections prepared by the Center 
for Global Development (CGD). Water ma-
nagement and access are a challenge for the 
whole continent, with increasingly frequent 
droughts and shortages, and they are the 
subject of targeted public policy, for example, 
in North Africa.

The climate emergency is another threat 
to Africa’s security, with a direct impact on 
levels of discord, as reflected, for example, 

in the Sahel and in disputes among seden-
tary and pastoral communities over access 
to water and other scarce resources, in an 
extremely fragile context.

Limited access to digitalization 
and research and development

The opportunities offered by the digital 
transformation in terms of disseminating 
expertise, creating businesses and jobs and, 
in a wider sense, of combating poverty and 
inequality run into the obstacle of limited 
and expensive internet access. According to 
the United Nations Educational, Scientific 
and Cultural Organization (UNESCO), just 
36% of the African population had broad-
band internet access in 2022. In its Digital 
Transformation Strategy for Africa (2020–
2030), the AU set an ultimate aim of a more 
integrated and inclusive digital society and 
economy in Africa.

The digital transformation has the potential 
to be a major driver of economic growth in 
Africa, but inadequate infrastructure is a se-

Spanish Cooperation project in Ethiopia: “Women, coffee and climate”.
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vere restraint, as are poorly suited regula-
tory frameworks and human capital that has 
not always received sufficient or relevant 
training.

In terms of innovation, Africa accounts for 
just 0.1% of the global total and spends a 
mere 0.45% of GDP on innovation and de-
velopment activities. Indeed, Africa is res-
ponsible for only 0.5% of global patent 
applications, a very low proportion when 
compared to Asia’s 66.5%.

Insufficient schooling and 
inadequate access to health 
care and the labour market

According to UNESCO, Africa remains the 
continent with the highest rates of illi-
teracy, even though significant advances 
have been recorded in recent years. Schoo-
ling, particularly of girls, is still a priority 
mission, especially in Sub-Saharan Afri-
ca, where dropout rates remain high, and 
school attendance rates are very low on ave-
rage (less than 50% of young people aged 
15–17 years). This problem is also linked to 
the frequency of forced or child marriages, 
which in the Sub-Saharan subregion affect 
39% of girls, and to pregnancy in under-18s. 
A quarter of African youth are estimated to 
be unemployed and with insufficient edu-
cation or training and this disproportiona-
tely affects young women, with only a few 
exceptions, such as Uganda. On the southern 
shore of the Mediterranean, job creation is a 
priority goal, as the societies there have high 
percentages of young people.

As regards health care coverage and social 
protection, the Covid-19 pandemic, millions 
more Africans fell into poverty and inequa-
lities rose dramatically. When the pandemic 
was declared, over half the population of 
Sub-Saharan Africa had inadequate health-
care access and 80% had no social protection 

or labour rights with which to tackle the af-
termath.

Violence and armed conflict

Turning to peace and security, some pro-
gress has been made, but there have also 
been setbacks, especially in fragile States. 
Africa is the continent that suffers the most 
violence and armed conflict. At present, half 
of the conflicts in the world are in Africa and 
43% of all terrorist attacks take place in the 
Sahel subregion.

Organized criminal groups, specializing in 
all forms of trafficking and smuggling, are 
extremely active on the continent of Africa. 
Some of the items they traffic—arms, oil, 
drugs, for example—are for consumption 
within the region, while others are headed 
for Mediterranean coastal areas, with the 
aim of introducing them into Europe or Asia.

Because territories within Africa contain lar-
ge deserts and unpopulated areas and have 
porous borders, the continent is conducive 
to criminal activities and terrorism. The se-
verity of this threat has led to establishment 
of large militarized zones with restricted ac-
cess in some countries, where there are of-
ten confrontations with criminal groups.

The INFORM 2024 Report by the Inter-
Agency Standing Committee and the Euro-
pean Commission, which analyses different 
humanitarian risk factors by country, found 
the Sahel (Mali, Niger, Burkina Faso and 
Chad) and the Horn of Africa (Sudan, Soma-
lia and South Sudan) to be the subregions 
that are most exposed to multi-factor hu-
manitarian crises. In recent years, owing to 
political instability in the two subregions, 
structural crises have worsened, leading to 
an increase in internally displaced persons 
and in refugees to neighbouring countries.
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Pre-existing food insecurity has become 
more acute as a result of ongoing conflict 
and violence, but also because of clima-
te change, which has led to an increase in 
droughts and natural disasters, with severe 
repercussions for the population, including 
dwindling livelihoods. Given this situation, 
current humanitarian priorities focus on 
protection, food security and nutrition and 
education in emergencies. 

The epicentre of terrorism has shifted in 
recent years from the Middle East to Afri-
ca. In 2007, around 7% of deaths caused by 
terrorist attacks occurred in Africa, but the 
percentage is now close to 50%. According 
to data from the Global Terrorism Index 
prepared by the Institute for Economics and 
Peace (IEP), in 2023 three of the five cou-
ntries that suffered the most attacks in the 
world were African: Burkina Faso, Somalia 
and Mali.

Within the continent, the subregions that 
have been most affected by terrorist acts, 
including those perpetrated by groups affi-
liated with Al-Qaida and with Islamic State, 
include the Sahel and, in the Horn of Africa, 
Somalia. There are also hotspots of violence 
and instability in the Sudan, in the wake of 
the internal conflict that erupted in 2023, in 
the east of the Democratic Republic of the 
Congo and the Great Lakes region, and the 
province of Cabo Delgado in the north of 
Mozambique. 

It is important to remember that one of the 
effects of terrorism is that States lose con-
trol over their territories and have difficul-
ties in providing basic services, leading to 
crises of confidence, delegitimization of ins-
titutions and breaking of the social compact. 

Deteriorations in security and recurrent vio-
lent conflicts are especially damaging be-
cause of the close link between peace, se-
curity and development, which has been 

acknowledged by the AU and by its partners 
such as Spain. Under this comprehensive 
approach to conflict in Africa, the political, 
social and economic factors at the root of 
violence—such as poverty, inequality, par-
tial democracy or human rights violations— 
must be addressed, rather than solely cases 
of violence. The greater the stability and se-
curity, the better the investment climate, the 
more jobs are created, the greater the de-
velopment of production capacities, and the 
more adequately the population’s needs are 
met. Of all of the social groups, women and 
girls are those who lose the most through 
violence and those who benefit the most 
from peace.

Fragile institutions

Although democracy is highly valued by Afri-
can societies and despite there being exam-
ples of democratic resilience and transfer of 
power, such as Cabo Verde, Ghana and South 
Africa, in recent years there have been coups 
d’état, unconstitutional changes of govern-
ment and a decline in the quality of demo-
cracy in terms of pluralism and freedoms, 
particularly in West Africa and above all the 
Sahel, where the sway of the EU is being 
partially dislodged.

These crises are reflected in the dissatisfac-
tion felt by the younger population, which 
accounts for a large portion of society, who-
se basic needs and aspirations concerning 
institutions and the labour market are not 
being met. The repercussions include mi-
gration, both within Africa and to Europe. 
Youth’s frustration is often exploited to un-
dermine democracies and cast doubt on their 
capacity to fulfil Africans’ legitimate aspi-
rations.
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Irregular migration, human 
trafficking and people 
smuggling

Rapid population growth, recurrent situa-
tions of instability and conflict, the reper-
cussions of the climate crisis and the pursuit 
of better economic and life opportunities 
are driving steady rises in African migratory 
flows. Most of the flows—over 70% accor-
ding to the International Organization for 
Migration (IOM)—are within the continent, 
either from rural areas to urban areas or bet-
ween African countries. In West Africa, this 
is the case for 9 out of every 10 migrants.

In recent years, however, there has been an 
uptrend in irregular migration from Africa 
to Europe and particularly from West Africa 
and the Maghreb. According to data from the 
European Border and Coast Guard Agency 
(Frontex), in 2023 around 47% of the irre-
gular migration into the EU was from Afri-
ca. Almost all arrivals are through human 
trafficking or people smuggling networks, 
whose members do not hesitate to put hu-
man lives in danger on the deadly routes 
across the Mediterranean and Atlantic. 

The networks also have close ties to other 
types of organized crime; therefore, not only 
are thousands of migrants putting their lives 
in danger, the networks are also a source of 
threats to security and public health in the 
two regions.
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Our assets

Geographical, historical, 
cultural and social ties

Because of its geographical location, histori-
cal ties, sense of responsibility and national 
interest, Spain can significantly contribute 
to the fulfilment of the aspirations, priori-
ties and goals that African governments and 
societies have set themselves in their conti-
nental and subregional strategies. Spain has 
invaluable resources, knowledge and rela-
tions with which to seize the opportunities 
offered by being Africa’s neighbour in Euro-
pe and to address shared challenges.   

4

Facade of the headquarters of Instituto Cervantes in 
Tétouan, Morocco.
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OUR AFRICAN NEIGHBOURS: 
WEST AFRICA, THE SAHEL 
AND NORTH AFRICA

Because of their proximity to Spain, the strength 
of the ties and their interdependence, the op-
portunities and challenges of West Africa, the 
Sahel and North Africa are critically important 
for Spain and will be paid special attention under 
this Strategy. This proximity is not only geogra-
phical, it is also historical and cultural in the case 
of the Arab world, forming a unique bond, ranging 
from interaction over the land borders of Ceuta 
and Melilla, to the extensive Mediterranean and 
Atlantic connections with the Maghreb and be-
yond. These ties extend from the Canary Islands 
to the Sahel, West Africa and the Gulf of Guinea. 
Significantly, five of the countries in North Africa 
form part of the Southern Neighbourhood of the 
European Union and six are in the Union for the 
Mediterranean (UfM). 

With its 16 countries and fifth of the continent’s 
land area (6 million square kilometres, 30 times 
the size of Spain), West Africa is home to a third 
of the population of Africa (412.5 million people 
in 2021, nine times the population of Spain). The 
subregion has a fertility rate of 5.2 births per wo-
man, which is in decline but remains above avera-
ge for the continent. In addition, there has been a 
considerable fall in infant mortality over the past 
decade (from 81.2 deaths per 1,000 births in 2010 
to 57.3 in 2021), reflecting progress in health care 
and education. People aged under 15 years accou-
nt for 43% of the total population, three times the 
percentage for Spain.

The economy of West Africa grew by almost 50% 
from 2010 to 2021 (from 459.23 billion euros to 
653.88 billion euros at current prices), and emplo-
yment rose in the industrial sector (13.9% of the 
total) and services (46.2%) but fell in agriculture 
(39.9%). At the same time, the urban population 
expanded in relative terms from 41% of the to-
tal in 2020 to 47% in 2021, signalling a growing 

middle class and demand for products and servi-
ces that are suited to their new needs, including 
mobility and energy infrastructure. At present, 
exports from ECOWAS countries are primarily of 
energy, mineral and agricultural products.

Spain is West Africa’s fifth largest export mar-
ket (ECOWAS countries, figures from 2021) at 
a total of 7.21 billion euros, ahead of France, the 
United States, Germany and the United Kingdom. 
However, Spain’s exports to the subregion amou-
nt to just 2.04 billion euros, 1.36% of the total.

Overall, Africa was the top source region for 
Spain’s oil imports in 2023, with Nigeria accou-
nting for 10.4%. In terms of natural gas, Algeria 
(29.3%) and Nigeria (13.6%) were Spain’s largest 
and fourth largest suppliers, respectively.

At the institutional level, although there have been 
coups d’état in Mali (2020), Guinea (2021), Burki-
na Faso (2022) and Niger (2023), the position of 
other countries in West Africa (Cabo Verde, Côte 
d'Ivoire, The Gambia, Guinea-Bissau, Mauritania, 
Sierra Leone and Senegal) in the Fragile States 
Index has improved, despite facing challenges 
such as terrorism and organized crime.

In terms of migration, citizens of countries in West 
Africa account for around a fifth (233,947 out of 
1,193,947) of African nationals residing in Spain.

What are we currently doing?

Spain has been strengthening its presence in 
the countries of West Africa since the launch of 
the first Plan Africa in 2006, opening new em-
bassies, subsidiary diplomatic offices and Spa-
nish Cooperation offices in 10 of the 15 ECOWAS 
States, including an Instituto Cervantes centre 
and university-hosted learning facilities.

Spain considers ECOWAS to be a key stakehol-
der in the subregion of West Africa and, for that 
reason, is in constant political dialogue with the 
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Community and has a close cooperation rela-
tionship with it, materialized among other initiati-
ves in a Memorandum of Understanding on Politi-
cal Consultations signed in 2023.

In applying the aforementioned Memorandum 
of Understanding and the declaration of intent 
signed on 12 January 2023, Spain and ECOWAS 
will present a new programme of work in the area 
of sustainable development cooperation. Spa-
nish Cooperation’s Master Plan for 2024–2027 
updates and strengthens the commitment with 
ECOWAS.

The Sahel, the climate and geographical tran-
sition zone to the south of the Sahara, faces the 
same significant challenges as the rest of the 
continent, but in the subregion the challenges are 
more frequent and severe. 

Although it has a young population, abundant 
natural resources and rich cultural heritage, the 
Sahel is also facing a situation of severe insta-

bility resulting in humanitarian impacts—with 
regard to which Spain is especially attentive and 
proactive—caused by a combination of terrorism, 
criminal networks including people smuggling 
networks, coups d’état and climate change aggra-
vated by the subregion’s particular vulnerability 
and fragility. The Sahel has also become a fertile 
ground—often cultivated by foreign powers—for 
sowing destabilizing narratives.

The increasingly unstable situation in the Sahel 
has led to a rise in migratory pressure on Spain 
and the rest of Europe. Equally concerning are 
the risk that the terrorist threat could spread to 
neighbouring countries, the impact of the civil war 
in Sudan, and the unrelenting criminal activity in 
many areas, such as the Lake Chad subregion.

What is more, countries in the central area of the 
Sahel that have experienced instability leading 
to coups d’état have formed the Alliance of Sahel 
States, which prioritizes security links with Russia 
and other actors.

The Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union and Cooperation with the President of the ECOWAS Commis-
sion, during the Minister’s visit to Nigeria in January 2023.
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Spain has spared no effort in its contributions 
to peace, stability and sustainable develo-
pment in the Sahel, for example, through our 
leadership of EU training missions, the parti-
cipation of Spanish law enforcement agencies 
in EU projects to strengthen institutions and 
through our work with the Sahel Alliance, the 
main platform for coordinating cooperation 
stakeholders in the subregion. Spain chaired 
the Alliance’s General Assembly for three con-
secutive years, owing to our country’s credibili-
ty and our understanding of the subregion and 
our historical and cultural ties. In this context, 
Spain has taken the lead in acknowledging 
Mauritania’s role as a pillar for the stability 
and development of the Sahel; Spain has the-
refore advocated greater attention from the 
EU with a view to strengthening its program-
mes and building its capacities.

What is more, in recent years Spain has stren-
gthened its relationship and support for the 
OECD Sahel and West Africa Club (SWAC/
OECD).

For the first time in Spanish law and with 
broad parliamentary backing, Act 1/2023 of 
20 February on Global Solidarity and Sustai-
nable Development Cooperation (hereinafter 
the GSSDC Act) established West Africa and 
the Sahel as priorities for Spanish Coopera-
tion.

While Spain’s ties with the whole of the conti-
nent are strong, with North Africa the bonds 
are even closer for geographical, historical 
and human reasons, as described in Spanish 
Cooperation’s Sixth Master Plan. All events 
in the Maghreb have a direct and immediate 

Third General Assembly of the Sahel Alliance, chaired by José Manuel Albares, held at the headquarters of 
the Ministry of Foreign Affairs, European Union and Cooperation in April 2022.
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impact in Spain, which aims to have excellent 
relations with all the countries of the subre-
gion. 

Spain has contributed to political dialogue in 
the region in different ways, through platforms 
such as the Western Mediterranean Forum (also 
known as the 5+5 Dialogue) and by hosting 
events such as the Seminar on Disarmament, 
Demobilization and Reintegration (DDR) in May 
2022 in Toledo, which was attended by Libyan 
authorities. 

The 5+5 Dialogue is the only initiative that spe-
cifically brings together the countries of the 
Maghreb, thus providing a space for coordina-
tion for an area that lacks any other multilateral 
forum in which to address issues that affect its 
two coasts. The Dialogue takes the form of a se-
ries of ministerial meetings, which have proven 
enormously useful on a range of issues, from 
water to security and defence.

As part of the European Union’s Southern 
Neighbourhood and of UfM, the countries of 
North Africa have historically received priority 
attention and have been strategic partners in 
designing and implementing agendas in areas 
of common interest, and this will continue.

In 2021, Spain spearheaded the relaunch of 
the European Neighbourhood Policy (ENP) 
concerning the Southern Neighbourhood, 
through adoption of the new Agenda for the 
Mediterranean. Today, as part of discussions 
on the review of the Agenda, Spain is leading 
work to strengthen the policy, with a clear aim 
of forging a bi-regional EU-Southern Neigh-
bourhood dynamic that complements the 
efforts by the EU and its Member States at 
the bilateral level. In this respect, Spain sup-
ports and actively fosters dialogue with the 
countries of North Africa, taking their inter-
ests and needs into account.

Simultaneously, complementing these activi-
ties, Spain has championed and continues to 
advocate strengthening of UfM. The Union is a 
particularly important body, as it is the only one 
that brings together the 27 Member States of 
the EU and 16 countries from the Eastern and 
Southern Mediterranean, including 6 States 
from North Africa (Mauritania, Morocco, Alge-
ria, Tunisia and Egypt, and Libya as an observer), 
enabling political dialogue, sectoral coopera-
tion and implementation of projects that produ-
ce impacts for citizens.

Looking ahead to the thirtieth anniversary of 
the Barcelona Process and in order to adapt 
UfM to the regional reality and present and fu-
ture needs, Spain is advocating a reformulation 
of its strategic priorities, greater political scope 
and a larger endowment of resources to enable 
the Union to fulfil its mandate effectively.

Spain, as a member of the North Atlantic Trea-
ty Organization (NATO) and an active propo-
nent of its Mediterranean Dialogues, has been 
particularly involved in strengthening the NATO 
approach to the Southern Neighbourhood, es-
pecially during the Summit in Madrid in 2023. 
The strengthening process, which also encom-
passes the Sahel and Africa, included adoption 
at the Washington Summit of a new action plan 
and appointment of a Spaniard as the first Spe-
cial Representative for the Southern Neighbou-
rhood. 

At the economic level, macroeconomic stability 
and investment opportunities in North Africa 
are increasingly important for Spanish busines-
ses. There are ever more business opportunities 
in sectors in which Spain has a genuine com-
petitive advantage such as construction, food, 
pharmaceuticals, renewable energy, water 
treatment and sanitation.
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Spain’s dual Atlantic and 
Mediterranean identity, and its 
European dimension 

Spain’s dual identity as an Atlantic and Me-
diterranean country affords it a key role in 
the configuration of a shared Euro-African 
space.

As an EU Member State, Spain actively con-
tributes to determining and implementing 
EU external policy on Africa, which inclu-
des the Joint AU-EU Innovation Agenda and 
the European Neighbourhood Policy concer-
ning the Southern Neighbourhood. The trips 
made by Spanish authorities alongside se-
nior EU officials, the monitoring of EU poli-
cies by the Council Working Parties and the 
permanent contact maintained with EU ins-

THE EUROPEAN UNION  
AND AFRICA

The European Union considers Africa a geopo-
litical priority, as its closest neighbouring conti-
nent with which it has significant historical, eco-
nomic and cultural ties. The EU is Africa’s main 
trade partner and investor and the principal do-
nor of development and humanitarian assistan-
ce to the continent. Since 2007, the relationship 
between the two has been considered a “strate-
gic partnership”, and coordinated through a sys-
tem of periodic summits, ministerial meetings 
and joint meetings of the EU College of Commis-
sioners and the AU Commission. In addition, the 
EU and Africa engage in multiple lines of dialo-
gue, instruments, mechanisms and sectoral ini-
tiatives on a broad range of issues. 

Recently, the EU and Africa have undertaken 
an exhaustive reform of the general legal fra-
mework within which their relationship is struc-
tured, with the signing, during the Spanish Pre-
sidency of the Council of the EU in the second 
half of 2023, of the Samoa Agreement between 
the EU and the countries of the Organisation of 
African, Caribbean and Pacific States (OACPS). 
This agreement, the successor to the Cotonou 
Agreement of 2000, adapts pre-existing com-
mitments, principles, mechanisms and institu-
tions to a changing global context.

Furthermore, the Sixth EU-UA Summit, held in 
February 2022, marked a turning point leading 
towards a new era of balanced, modernized and 
action-focused relations. The leaders of the two 
continents signed a declaration entitled “A 
Joint Vision for 2030” based on: an Investment 
Package of at least 150 billion euros in the 
framework of the Global Gateway strategy; a 
renewed and enhanced cooperation for peace 
and security; an enhanced and reciprocal part-
nership for migration and mobility and mobi-
lity; and a commitment to multilateralism 
within the rules-based international order, with 
the UN at its core. 

This investment package is intended to con-
tribute to the achievement of the priorities set 
forth in the AU Agenda 2063. Specifically, it 
is intended to drive the competitiveness and 

The President of the Government during the Fourth 
European Union-African Union Summit.
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titutions and services (European Commis-
sion and European External Action Service), 
are reflections of the European dimension of 
our efforts.

Spain also facilitates policy coordination and 
the identification of cooperation opportuni-
ties with EU financing through its partner-
ship policy with Africa. Taking into account 
the strategic importance of the continent for 

Spain and the EU, Spain will take the inter-
ests and concerns of African countries into 
account during EU debates on policies that 
have a particular impact on the continent, in 
particular in the economic sphere (renewal 
of sustainable fisheries partnership agree-
ments (SFPAs), new rules or conditions on 
specific matters, such as agreements on the 
promotion and protection of investments). 

sustainable development of Africa, foster the 
consolidation of modern economies, stren-
gthen the infrastructure connecting the two 
continents and create a business climate con-
ducive to investment and growth. Moreover, the 
creation and strengthening of value chains will 
help to consolidate the foundations for the suc-
cess of AfCFTA.

As regards trade and economic affairs, both 
continents are paying particular attention to 
nurturing relations through regional partners-
hip agreements and through the consolidation 
of AfCFTA. These efforts have facilitated an in-
crease in the intensity of trade and investment, 
with the additional aim of favouring sustaina-
ble development. Similarly, in recent years Eu-
rope has sought to strengthen economic and 
trade relations with specific African partners 
through the signing of Economic Partnership 
Agreements (EU-Kenya) and other innovative 
instruments, such as the EU-Angola Sustaina-
ble Investment Facilitation Agreement and the 
EU-Rwanda Memorandum of Understanding on 
Sustainable Raw Materials Value Chains.

On the basis of the shared strategic goals and 
positions reflected in the EU-AU declaration “A 
Joint Vision for 2030”, Spain will also contribute 
to more intense dialogue and coordination bet-
ween the EU and Africa in multilateral forums.

Due to Spain’s geopolitical position, our close 
ties with the African continent, and the percep-
tion of our country as sharing a special affinity 
with Africa, Spain aspires to exercise greater 
leadership in the efforts to enhance EU rela-
tions with Africa, thereby contributing to the 
fulfilment of the commitments adopted at the 
Sixth EU-AU Summit. 

We must foster a renewed partnership, based 
on equality and mutual respect, and together 
address the challenges faced by Africa. In the 
current international context, the African Sta-
tes have a broad range of partnership options 
in several spheres. It is incumbent upon the EU 
and its Member States to design proposals that 
are better suited to the development needs of 
our African neighbours. 

To achieve this goal of renewing our relations-
hip with Africa, the EU must prove itself a re-
liable partner, setting and achieving realistic 
goals and honouring its commitments. It must 
deliver on its promises and statements with 
action, both in the sphere of political dialogue, 
duly attending and paying political attention to 
coordination initiatives such as summits and 
ministerial meetings, and with respect to the 
provision of financing.
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SPAIN AND THE AFRICAN 
UNION

The African Union is a key stakeholder in 
the global and continental order and its in-
fluence only continues to grow. At a global 
level, the organization enjoys the legitimacy 
accorded it by the fact that its membership 
includes all the African States; at a conti-
nental level, its commitment to democracy 
and human rights, its promotion of AfCFTA 
and its engineering of the African Peace 
and Security Architecture have earned it a 
central role in the efforts to make Africa an 
integrated, stable and prosperous space, 
inspired by the Agenda 2063.

Spain considers the AU a key partner, with 
the authority to speak on behalf of the con-
tinent, and recognizes its leadership in all 
regional and international efforts aimed at 
consolidating democracy, stability and sus-
tainable development on the continent. The 
signing, in May 2022, of a memorandum of 
understanding established an institutionali-
zed political dialogue that we must expand 
and develop in the coming years. 

The AU, moreover, is a forum of great poten-
tial for the relationship between the conti-
nent and Ibero-America. The official status 
of Spanish within the organization and its 
growing use in communications must be 
supported through voluntary contributions 
and other language diplomacy actions. 

ADAPTING OUR PRESENCE 
AND COMMUNICATIONS 
TO OPPORTUNITIES

What are we currently doing? 

Having years of experience of undertaking 
development cooperation projects, partici-
pating in peace and security missions, for-
ging political agreements and designing 
cooperation mechanisms, Spain enjoys ex-
cellent dialogue with our African partners. 

For many years now, Spain has maintained 
high-level meetings and consultation me-
chanisms with Spanish civil society and 
the Spanish private sector. Meanwhile, our 
diplomatic, trade and cooperation presen-
ce on the ground in Africa has been indis-
pensable to building networks of relations, 
producing tangible impacts and generating 
first-hand knowledge of the continent’s si-
tuation and circumstances.

All of this has helped to shape the strategic 
goals of the bilateral agenda and fostered 
cooperation from a political perspective.

What more can we do?

Spain is aware that a more strategic rela-
tionship calls for enhanced dialogue and 
broader-reaching and more frequent con-
tact which will lead to a better understan-
ding of our actions and priorities.

To achieve this, Spain’s foreign action 
should ideally be planned based on our ca-
pabilities, identifying the sectors—trade, 
scientific, cultural—in which to capitalize 
on national competencies. Public-private 
partnerships and economic, cultural and 
scientific diplomacy instruments enable the 
creation of markets in emerging countries 
for the export of Spanish services of high 
added value.
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High-level dialogue with 
African stakeholders. Network 
of cooperation agreements and 
mechanisms

Spain’s political dialogue with Africa is ba-
sed on the recognition of the key role of the 
AU as a pan-African organization with broad 
powers encompassing economic integration, 
development, peace, security and democracy. 

Spain has entered into a growing network 
of cooperation agreements and mechanisms 
with the AU, such as the Memorandum of 
Understanding on Political Dialogue and 
Sectoral Collaboration signed in 2022 and 
the collaboration agreements between the 
Spanish International Development Coo-
peration Agency (Spanish acronym: AECID) 
and AUDA-NEPAD. In addition, Spain also 
promotes other forums for cooperation, such 
as the 5+5 Dialogue, whose flexible and in-
formal nature offers added value, favouring 
sectoral cooperation with North Africa.

Spain also maintains excellent relations 
with ECOWAS and has lent its support to 
implementation of the ECOWAS Vision 2050.

In parallel, Spain has also been making a 
substantial effort to strengthen political, 
economic, trade and cooperation relations 
with the countries of Southern, East and 
Central Africa, including through high-
level visits and regular political consulta-
tions. Consideration could also be given to 
enhancing this relationship by increasing 
engagement with subregional organizations 
such as the Southern African Development 
Community (SADC).

Africa’s increasing importance for Spain 
led to the creation, in 2017, of a Directo-
rate-General for (Sub-Saharan) Africa—an 
offshoot of the Directorate-General for the 
Maghreb, the Middle East and the Medite-
rranean—within the organizational struc-
ture of the Foreign Ministry. Of all the bo-
dies forming part of the Spanish diplomatic 
system, this Directorate-General manages 
relations with the largest number of sove-
reign African States (48) and international 
organizations, with a growing bilateral and 
regional agenda, in addition to working in 
coordination with the Directorate-General 
for the Maghreb, the Mediterranean and the 
Middle East on a comprehensive policy for 
the entire continent.

MULTILATERAL 
COORDINATION

Inclusive multilateralism is crucial to achieving 
the SDGs and to tackling mounting crises. 

Strengthening cooperation, accountability 
and inclusivity in multilateral forums is essen-
tial to increasing trust in the system and to 
guaranteeing its effectiveness, acceptance 
and transparency.

Spain seeks to develop its relationship with 
Africa not only at the bilateral level, but also 

within the multilateral sphere. We share many 
common interests and, through synergies 
and support for our decisions and initiatives, 
we can achieve real progress. We consider it 
important to forge robust partnerships with 
African partners to give impetus to collective 
action and we will listen actively to their con-
cerns through continuous contact, with a view 
to building consensus and interregional part-
nerships.
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What are we currently doing?

Spain’s engagement to host the Fourth In-
ternational Conference on Financing for 
Development is a reflection of our com-
mitment to achieving consensus, to initiating 
dialogue, and to nurturing ties between the 
North and the South.

In the multilateral sphere Spain collaborates 
closely with a number of African countries 
on the following matters: the women, peace 
and security agenda (WPSA); the fight aga-
inst female genital mutilation; the fight aga-
inst and prevention of violent extremism; hu-
manitarian concerns such as the protection 
of schools during armed conflicts; interna-
tional justice; and drought—Spain and Se-
negal launched the International Drought 
Resilience Alliance (IDRA) during the twen-
ty-seventh session of the Conference of the 
Parties to the United Nations Framework 
Convention on Climate Change (COP27).

In the regional sphere we support the AU (in 
2023 Spain announced a contribution of 50 
million euros for the AU and 20 million euros 
for AUDA-NEPAD) as well as subregional 
bodies such as ECOWAS (Spain’s annual 
contribution to the latter is close to 4 million 
euros).

Access to international financing must be 
prioritized. It is practically impossible for 
a State acting alone to produce a decisive 
impact on the development of a continent 
with more than a billion inhabitants and ra-
pid forecast population growth. International 
financing is crucial to development in Africa. 
This is why Spain is hosting the Fourth Inter-
national Conference on Financing for Deve-
lopment, to be held in 2025.

Considering the current context, characte-
rized by rapid population growth and signi-

ficant deficiencies, the financing needed to 
make decisive progress towards the SDGs 
must necessarily be based on the four lines 
of action defined below, taking into account 
that each source of financing matters.

1.	 Strengthen the lending capacity of mul-
tilateral development banks. Spain has 
reached an agreement with the Interna-
tional Monetary Fund (IMF) and the World 
Bank to channel an additional 1.5 billion in 
special drawing rights (SDRs) to the Resi-
lience and Sustainability Trust.

2.	 Reduce the sovereign debt burden.  This 
is a collective undertaking in which all 
creditor countries must participate, each 
making a similar effort. In this regard, 
Spain advocates creating multilateral ins-
truments for this purpose. 

3.	 Promote private investment.  Internatio-
nal investment flows greatly exceed the 
total sum of Official Development Assis-
tance. However, only a small proportion 
of these flows reach Africa. The principal 
obstacle is the perception of investment 
risk. In this regard, mechanisms to gua-
rantee, insure and promote investments 
must be improved and strengthened at 
the national and multilateral levels. Sta-
tes that seek to attract investment must 
also adopt the regulatory measures that 
will reduce this perception of risk. 
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Instruments to support bilateral 
trade and Spanish investment. 
Spanish companies heading 
strategic African sectors

Economic relations between Spain and 
Africa have been characterized in recent 
years by growing bilateral trade. This has 
been due in part to the rise in energy imports 
resulting from the need for diversification 
(created in turn by Russia’s aggression 
against Ukraine), but it also reflects the 
prudence of shortening value chains in a 
changeable geopolitical context. Spanish 
trade with Africa is largely with North Africa 
(66% of the total). Spain’s principal trade 
partner in Africa is Morocco, followed by 
Algeria, Nigeria, Libya and South Africa.

Significantly, the value of Spain’s exports 
to Africa exceeds that of its exports to Latin 
America (10.43 billion euros compared with 
9.76 billion euros in the first half of 2024, 
respectively, but this has generally been the 
case for a number of years) and the value 
of the goods we import from Africa greatly 
exceeds that of the goods we import from 
Latin America (18.23 billion euros compared 
with 11.87 billion euros in the first half of 
2024, respectively).

As regards Spanish foreign direct investment, 
Spain’s stocks in Africa totalled close to 5.95 
billion euros in 2022, with Morocco, Algeria, 
South Africa and Angola being the main 
recipients. 

Spain must build or strengthen supply 
chains for critical commodities with 
African countries. In this regard, Spain 
has implemented a reference framework (a 
road map for the sustainable management 
of mineral raw materials) to strengthen 
and improve its strategic autonomy with 
a more sustainable, circular, safe and 
efficient extractive activity, improving 
the competitiveness of its companies and 
collaborating actively to achieve the goals of 
the energy transition, climate neutrality and 
the demographic challenge.

Africa’s energy system should progress 
towards renewable resources, and steer itself 
away from fossil fuels. It needs to focus on 
distributed generation and self-supply and 
to adapt its power grids accordingly.

The State Secretariat for Trade approved the 
Horizon Africa Strategy in July 2020, revised 
in November 2023, to increase the corporate, 
institutional and financial presence of Spain 
on the African continent. 

The President of the Government at the presentation of the Alianza África Avanza initiative to foster inves-
tment in Senegal, during the President’s visit to Dakar in August 2024. 
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PARTNERS IN ENERGY 
AND THE ECOLOGICAL 
TRANSITION

Faced with the challenge of increasing 
access to electricity in Africa, in a manner 
compatible with the decarbonization goals 
adopted by the international community, 
Spain and its companies must position 
themselves as key partners for African 
countries.

The International Energy Agency (IEA) cal-
culates that Africa needs an investment in 
reliable, sustainable and accessible elec-
tricity infrastructure amounting to appro-
ximately 2 trillion euros over the next two 
decades. According to the International 
Renewable Energy Agency (IRENA), a sys-
tematic transition in Africa from fossil 
fuels to renewable energy could increase 

GDP by 6.4%, jobs by 3.5% and the Energy 
Transition Welfare Index by 25% by 2050, 
if an appropriate policy basket were also 
applied. 

The generation and distribution of electrici-
ty are sectors offering enormous opportuni-
ty, in which Spanish companies are already 
present. 

For its part, the rise of renewable energies, 
including solar, wind and green hydrogen 
energy, is in line with the Global Gateway 
priorities set for countries such as Maurita-
nia, Kenya and Namibia. 

In this regard, Africa’s blue economy has 
great potential that has yet to be fully re-
cognized. The AU forecasts that by 2030 the 
blue economy will have created 57 million 
jobs. 

Solar power plant in South Africa. 
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THE GLOBAL GATEWAY

The Global Gateway, launched on 1 Decem-
ber 2021, is an EU connectivity strategy to 
promote sustainable investment, aligned 
with the goals of the digital and ecological 
transitions.

At the EU-AU Summit held on 18 February 
2022, the EU announced an Africa-Europe 
investment package of at least 150 billion 
euros with a view to strengthening the ties 
between the two continents and forging 
mutually beneficial partnerships whose 
added value will make it possible to coun-
ter the offers of other actors, such as Chi-
na. Spain advocates adopting a Team Eu-
rope approach to implement these funds, 
with the coordinated participation of all key 
stakeholders, including public stakeholders 
from EU institutions and Member States, 
private sector stakeholders, and multilateral 
development banks.

Spain champions the effective mobilization 
of these resources in collaboration with our 
African partners, with a permanent focus 
on sustainable development outcomes, to 
identify partnership opportunities that will 
respond to the true priorities of the African 
continent.

Spanish companies must place their inter-
national experience at the service of this ini-
tiative. In addition, export credit agencies, 
financial development institutions and bo-
dies offering financial instruments to sup-
port the internationalization of companies 
must coordinate with each other to remove 
obstacles to financing.

Global Gateway is not free from challenges, 
including communications with and the visi-
bility of partner countries, the mobilization 
of financial resources, the structuring of 
instruments with governance institutions 
and the coordination of operations.

Lagos port, Nigeria.
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On the occasion of the visit of the President of 
the Government to Senegal in August 2024, 
Spain launched the Alianza África Avanza 
initiative, which seeks to establish a stable 
and flexible common strategic framework 
that maximizes the impact of investments 
on economic development and social pro-
gress, especially in West Africa. Senegal has 
been selected, not only as the host country 
of Alianza’s secretariat, but also as the cou-
ntry in which it will commence its activities, 
which may be extended to other countries in 
the region.

To achieve its goals, Alianza aims, firstly, 
to tackle horizontal challenges and clear 
bottlenecks that could hinder growth, fos-
tering access to basic financial services and 
addressing the digital divide. Secondly, it 
intends to favour investment in strategic 
sectors with the potential to create jobs, in-
cluding finance, infrastructure, telecommu-
nications, agricultural transformation and 
tourism, focusing on the African country’s 
own agenda and priorities. 

Lastly, Alianza is committed to training, 
which is essential if the continent’s human 
capital is to fulfil its potential. To this end, 
Alianza will involve all key stakeholders in 
the country’s economic development, inclu-
ding national public authorities and compa-
nies and international financial institutions, 
all following a single shared road map.

The fight against energy poverty is a distin-
guishing feature of Spain’s energy policy. 
Inter-ministerial collaboration at the servi-
ce of specific AECID programmes to combat 
energy poverty within ECOWAS States will 
maximize programme outcomes and con-
tribute to the international prestige of our 
policy.

Spain has leading companies and institu-
tions in those sectors identified by the Glo-
bal Gateway strategy as of key interest for 

Africa: digital, climate and energy, blue eco-
nomy, transport, health, research, and edu-
cation and training. Coupled with the role 
of Spanish Cooperation in supporting these 
same priorities through financing and tech-
nical cooperation, this situation constitutes 
an excellent point of departure for promo-
ting sustainable investment in Africa, to 
which half of the Global Gateway budget has 
been assigned.

Spain’s network of economic and tra-
de offices at embassies in Africa (15 offi-
ces providing services across the continent) 
offers essential support to our companies to 
maximize the business potential of African 
markets.

Spanish Cooperation projects 
with an impact in Africa. More 
than 40 years of engagement 
and high-level dialogue

Official Development Assistance 

The GSSDC Act sets forth Spain’s goal of 
allocating at least 0.7% of gross national 
income to Official Development Assistance 
by 2030. This effort must be made with the 
aim of advancing achievement of the 2030 
Agenda and the SDGs. Accordingly, Spain 
will continue to strengthen and increase its 
cooperation with African countries. In this 
regard, Spanish Cooperation’s Master Plan 
for 2024-2027 includes three lines of action 
of particular relevance:

1.	 Strengthening work on inclusive econo-
mic development. In this sphere, particular 
emphasis will be placed on the creation of 
opportunities for young people, especia-
lly young women, to enable African cou-
ntries to effectively combat poverty and 
inequalities and to create quality jobs for 
the 30 million Africans that will enter the 
labour force each year from 2030 onward.  



49

SPANISH COOPERATION

What are we currently doing?

Spanish Cooperation has extensive expe-
rience in Africa and is especially important 
in subregions such as the Sahel, from which 
other parties are withdrawing. Spanish Coo-
peration partners with and listens to its local 
counterparts, whether they be State, regio-
nal or local institutions, private sector bodies 
or civil society organizations, while ensuring 
accountability and transparency. 

The proactive stance adopted by Spanish 
Cooperation among donors groups and coor-
dination platforms makes Spain an attrac-
tive partner for other stakeholders with a 
presence in Africa, thus helping to stren-
gthen our common efforts and our relations 
with partners such as the EU, the EU Mem-
ber States that are most active in Africa and 
the United States of America. 

In addition, our presence in the different su-
bregions of the continent could potentially 
facilitate triangular cooperation between 
them, which could in turn contribute towards 
strengthening their integration and interde-
pendence. With this same aim, different re-
gional programmes have been established 
with AUDA-NEPAD, ECOWAS and the Masar 
Al’an Programme for the Arab world, inclu-
ding North Africa. 

Spain rolls out the foreign action educatio-
nal programmes that it establishes based 
on the needs identified with its African part-
ners. The aim is to respond to the demand 
for training from local teachers in teaching 
Spanish as a foreign language, with particu-
lar attention to the need to teach Spanish for 
specific purposes. The first Instituto Cervan-
tes centre in Sub-Saharan Africa—with offi-
ces in Dakar—has been opened and inter-

university cooperation between Spanish and 
African universities is being supported. The-
re are also plans to extend the work of the 
Instituto Cervantes centre in Rabat to Mau-
ritania and to open new facilities in Angola. 

Spanish Cooperation has long been com-
mitted to providing training in the cultural 
sector through the ACERCA programme. 
Similarly, in the sphere of educational coo-
peration, it supports vocational training 
centres that aim to address the misalign-
ment between the training and skills of the 
labour force—in particular those of young 
people—and the training and skills needed 
for the transformation of the production sys-
tem and for the ongoing ecological and digi-
tal transitions.

The International and Ibero-American Foun-
dation for Administration and Public Poli-
cies (FIIAPP), as a cooperation system entity 
specialized in public technical cooperation, 
carries out institutional exchange projects 
to strengthen regulatory frameworks and 
public institutions and policy in Africa. This 
work addresses multiple areas of the 2030 
Agenda, such as local governance (the Sup-
port to Civil Society in Local Governance in 
Angola [PASCAL] Project), the digital eco-
nomic transition (support for the implemen-
tation of the African Continental Free Trade 
Area Agreement and for digital government 
and cybersecurity in the Horn of Africa), and 
the social transition (youth policy program-
mes implemented in Morocco and Tunisia).
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Investment in vocational training and en-
trepreneurship as well as in food security 
and nutrition and rural development will 
be especially important.

2.	 Intensifying efforts to combat the climate 
crisis and its impacts within the context of 
a just ecological transition. This line of ac-
tion will especially prioritize needs relating 
to climate change adaptation, natural-di-
saster resilience, and water and sanitation. 
In this sphere, Spain undertakes to support 
African countries in their efforts to guaran-
tee universal, affordable and reliable access 
to clean energy sources by promoting the 
use of renewable energy and improving 
energy efficiency and fostering research, 
technological development and capacity-
building in sustainable energy systems.

3.	 Recognizing gender equality as an es-
sential, cross-cutting and distinguishing 
feature of Spain’s collaboration with our 
partner countries in Africa, in line with 
Spanish Cooperation’s commitment to 
feminism. In this line of action Spain will 
seek to reduce inequalities between wo-
men and men, intensify efforts to close 
gender gaps, combat all forms of violence 
and discrimination, promote the politi-
cal, economic and social empowerment of 
women, young girls and adolescent girls, 
and guarantee their sexual and reproduc-
tive rights from a human rights perspec-
tive.

Pursuant to Article 31.4 of the GSSDC Act, 
AECID, as part of its Master Plan, exercises 
the operational coordination of the coopera-
tion carried out by the Spanish sustainable 
development cooperation system at head-
quarter, regional and country level, applying 
the principles of effectiveness, complemen-
tarity and coherence.

With a view to fostering regional coopera-
tion in Africa and the Middle East, Spanish 

Cooperation’s Master Plan (2024-2027) en-
visages the following actions: 

a.	 Drafting of a Spanish Cooperation strate-
gy for Sub-Saharan Africa. 

b.	 Preparation of a new subregional coo-
peration strategy for the Southern 
Mediterranean that adapts Spanish 
Cooperation’s goals and resources to the 
challenges currently faced by the subre-
gion, prioritizing alignment of activities 
throughout the Southern Neighbour-
hood and favouring establishment of 
lasting partnerships in the subregion.

c.	 Renewal of regional cooperation pro-
grammes with ECOWAS, especially in 
fields such as agriculture, renewable 
energy and gender equality, and with 
the AUDA-NEPAD, among others.

d.	 Continuation of efforts in West Africa, 
paying special attention to the Sahel and 
drawing on lessons learned by Spain 
when chairing the General Assembly of 
the Sahel Alliance to support countries 
in the subregion.

In the humanitarian sphere, particular im-
petus has been given in recent years to pro-
grammes related to education in emergen-
cies, gender and protection linked especially 
to displaced persons and refugees. Given the 
aforementioned structural problems, health 
and food security continue to be priority 
areas for Spain’s humanitarian action.

In the humanitarian sphere, Spain also has 
a humanitarian strategy for the 2022–2023 
period for the Sahel and is working to pro-
duce the strategy for the following period.

The Foreign Ministry has introduced the 
“country-team” mechanism for coordina-
ting the actions of public administrations 
and Spanish Cooperation. The goal is to 
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structure and coordinate cooperation actions 
on a country-by-country basis. This mecha-
nism has been adopted with Mauritania and 
will be rolled out to other countries.

Creation of value in Africa 
through youth training

Cooperation in the spheres of education 
and employment

Spain has a long-standing tradition of enga-
ging in educational and cultural cooperation 
with Africa, fostered by a variety of diffe-
rent stakeholders, concentrated primarily 
on Morocco and Equatorial Guinea (Cultural 
Centres of Malabo and Bata).

The Africa-MED and ASALE study grant 
programmes (organized by AECID), the Ca-
nary Islands-Africa programmes (regional 
administration of the Canary Islands), the 
Learn Africa programme (Women for Afri-
ca Foundation) and the EU Erasmus+ pro-
gramme have been offering training oppor-
tunities in Spain to young professionals and 
researchers from Africa, while at the same 
time helping to build networks of knowledge 
and interests connecting participant institu-
tions and beneficiaries alike. Raisa, the visi-
tors’ programme for African women leaders 
run by AECID is another example of this line 
of work, as is the “Africa for African business 
people” visitors’ programme and the diplo-
mat training programme for ECOWAS coun-
tries. Equally important is the programme of 
assistantships at African universities, which 
is consolidated by a steady year-on-year in-
crease in the number of participants.

More recently, Spain and Senegal have sig-
ned a number of memorandums of unders-
tanding on the social and solidarity economy 
and on labour inspection. Technical assis-
tance for the capacity-building of public 
authorities and other bodies in the sphere of 

labour, occupational health and safety and 
social dialogue has also been increased. 

This Strategy proposes, among other mea-
sures, the creation of a foundation to foster 
relations with Africa, with a particular focus 
on employment and educational opportuni-
ties for African youth. 

This new foundation will work to create a 
Hispano-African space for knowledge and 
will serve as a public diplomacy tool aimed 
at ensuring better mutual knowledge bet-
ween Africa and Spain. The potential activi-
ties of this foundation include the provision 
of courses or study grants to African edu-
cators and students as well as exchanges of 
experts and collaboration in areas of com-
mon interest with other African foundations.

Promotion of the Spanish language. Cul-
tural and scientific cooperation

The dissemination of the Spanish langua-
ge across the African continent serves three 
objectives: strengthening Spain’s influence 
in African institutions and societies; ex-
panding the markets for our cultural and 
creative industries; and contributing to the 
capacity-building of the population, with a 
view to fostering professions that are linked 
to Spain and the Spanish-speaking world, 
in the worlds of diplomacy, business, arts 
and research. The recognition of Spanish 
as a working language of the African Union 
in 2020 is a further incentive to continuing 
work in this regard. 

Africa has an ever-increasing number of 
students of Spanish  

Instituto Cervantes is present in 19 cities 
across seven countries on the continent. The 
main facilities are in Morocco (six centres 
and six subsidiary facilities), Algeria (two 
centres), Egypt (one centre and one subsi-
diary facility), Tunisia (one centre) and Se-



52

negal (one centre, opened in 2020, the first 
in Sub-Saharan Africa). Instituto Cervantes 
is expected to soon have a facility in Ango-
la. Instituto Cervantes is also present in Côte 
d’Ivoire (university-hosted Instituto Cer-
vantes facilities in Abidjan) and Mauritania 
(a subsidiary facility in Nouakchott, which 
will open soon). These centres also have as-
signed exam centres and accredited centres 
in a total of 10 African countries. In addition, 
the ASALE programme organized by AECID 
awards study grants to citizens of Equatorial 
Guinea to enable them to take the Master’s 
degree in lexicography and teaching practi-
ces offered by the Equatoguinean Academy 
of the Spanish Language.

According to the document El español: una 
lengua viva. Informe 2023 [Spanish: a living 
language. 2023 Report], coordinated by Ins-
tituto Cervantes and available on its websi-
te, some 2,070,000 people in Sub-Saharan 
Africa are currently studying Spanish (9% 
of the world total). The countries with the 
highest numbers of students of Spanish on 
the continent are Côte d'Ivoire (566,178 stu-
dents), Benin (412,515), Senegal (356,000), 
Cameroon (193,018), Gabon (167,410) and 
Equatorial Guinea (128,895). 

One of the channels of our cooperation with 
potential is scientific diplomacy, which ser-
ves as a support instrument owing to its 
contribution to addressing global challen-
ges, such as climate change, food security 
and public health, and by driving the eco-
nomic output and competitiveness of States. 

Spain’s scientific sector encompasses a 
plethora of specializations and is represen-
ted around the world. The sector’s activity is 
largely coordinated by the Spanish National 
Research Council (Spanish acronym: CSIC).

Spanish companies in different sectors 
export products and services or operate 
abroad. In order to do business abroad as 

they do in Spain, these companies need the 
countries to which they export, or in which 
they operate, to strengthen the capabilities 
of their scientific sectors. One example is the 
fisheries sector: there is a sizeable Spanish 
fishing fleet in Angola, Namibia and South 
Africa that is required to comply with the 
rules of the EU Common Fisheries Policy 
and, therefore, to provide scientific evidence 
of a surplus of fish stocks in any waters in 
which they operate. 

To maximize the return on cooperation ac-
tions in the sphere of science, Spain can-
not rely solely on public sector resources, 
but must also seek supplementary support 
from the private sector. This will ensure that 
outcomes are sustainable, which is key to 
continued activity. 

There are already groups of Spanish scien-
tists in Africa, such as the Association of 
Spanish Scientists in Southern Africa (Spa-
nish acronym: ACESDA) and the Spanish 
scientists that collaborate with the Man-
hiça Health Research Centre in Mozambique 
(Portuguese acronym: CISM). These scien-
tists’ efforts are invaluable to our scientific 
cooperation. 

Openness to civil society

African civil society—both from the conti-
nent itself and from the diaspora—is calling 
on Spain and other partners to listen to their 
diverse voices when designing, implemen-
ting and evaluating policies and initiatives 
concerning and affecting Africa. Spain is 
mindful of this call and its approach to Afri-
ca centres on listening to African societies, 
and understanding their visions and prio-
rities. This interest and openness is reflec-
ted, among other measures, by the relaunch 
in 2020 of the Africa Round Table, which 
provides a forum for dialogue, and the for-
mulation of proposals by civil society, un-
derstood in the broadest sense, to the bodies 
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that design and implement Spain’s policy of 
partnership with the continent.

Casa África was created in 2006 as a public 
sector consortium formed by the Foreign 
Ministry, the regional administration of the 
Canary Islands and the city council of Las 
Palmas de Gran Canaria. Since then, it has 
cemented its role as an instrument of eco-
nomic, cultural and digital public diplomacy, 
with an extensive programme to forge con-
nections between Spanish and African socie-
ty, and among their companies, creators and 
cultural industries. Every year, numerous 
agents of change in Africa through its head-
quarters in Las Palmas de Gran Canaria, and 
their contributions are reaching an increa-
singly large audience owing to the possibi-
lities offered by digital media. Among other 
resources, Casa África maintains a valuable 
database on African public figures from the 
world of business, science, the media and 
the arts, a result of its almost 20 years of 
activity.

The Cultural Centres of Spain in Bata and 
Malabo are indispensable pillars of the so-
cial and cultural space in Equatorial Guinea. 
These centres have been pioneers, not only 
by offering training in fields related to cul-
tural management, but also by fostering ci-
tizen participation and civil society engage-
ment in spaces governed by the principles of 
freedom and democracy. With a highly ex-
tensive and varied cultural programme, the-
se centres have been consolidated as a mee-
ting place for young people, intellectuals, 
creators, artists and the general public. They 
have also served as hubs for formation of re-
gional networks and connections and repre-
sent an excellent platform for increasing and 
strengthening Spanish cultural cooperation 
in other African countries.

Spain’s position as a close and 
reliable partner, committed to 
peace and security

Women, peace and security

Spain has played a leading role in promo-
ting the women, peace and security agen-
da through programmes and collaborations 
with African partners, including regional 
partners such as ECOWAS, national and ci-
vil society partners, and UN agencies such 
as the United Nations Entity for Gender 
Equality and the Empowerment of Women 
(UN-Women) and the United Nations Po-
pulation Fund (UNFPA). In addition, Spain 
pays particular attention to the fragility of 
post-conflict areas, and has been supporting 
reconstruction projects and initiatives linked 
to disarmament, demobilization and reinte-
gration with the aim of fostering reconci-
liation, promoting stability, and preventing 
relapses into insecure situations.

Spain is committed to strengthening the role 
of women in conflict resolution and peace-
building on the African continent. Through 
AECID, Spain has co-financed support for 
the implementation and monitoring of the 
Women, Peace and Security National Action 
Plans of Mozambique and Sudan, as well as 
the preparation of that of Chad, presented in 
2023. In addition, Spanish Cooperation ca-
rries out capacity-building activities aimed 
at strengthening prevention and mediation 
tools, including the training session for wo-
men mediators in West Africa and the Sahel, 
held in Niger in March 2023. 

Supporting capabilities

Spain also cooperates by providing intelli-
gence, equipment and support to regional 
initiatives to strengthen the counter-terro-
rist capabilities of African States, such as the 
International Academy for the Fight Against 
Terrorism in Jacqueville (Côte d'Ivoire), the 
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PEACE AND SECURITY

What are we currently doing?

Aware that violence is an overwhelming 
obstacle to development, Spain has intensi-
fied its partnership with Africa in the sphe-
re of peace and security. In addition to the 
presence of our armed forces in a number 
of EU, NATO and UN missions and military 
operations in Africa, Spain also takes part in 
forums that foster mutual trust and security 
and defence cooperation such as the 5+5 De-
fence Initiative, and is engaged in a growing 
number of bilateral military cooperation ac-
tivities. Furthermore, Spain’s law enforce-
ment agencies participate in civilian crisis 
management missions in various subregions 
of the continent, including the Gulf of Guinea 
and the Indian Ocean and countries such as 
Libya, Mali, Niger, the Central African Repu-
blic, Mozambique and Somalia. Spain is in-
volved in this sphere both through bilateral 
frameworks and through EU, NATO and UN 
actions.

Spain also cooperates by providing intelli-
gence, equipment and support to regional 
initiatives aimed at strengthening the coun-
ter-terrorist capabilities of African States.

Spain considers that both the EU and NATO 
should extend and intensify dialogue and 
cooperation with the Southern Neighbour-
hood, and collaborate more closely with Afri-
ca.

Our country promotes and supports the na-
tional women, peace and security agendas 
of African countries, and is assisting regio-
nal African mediation processes relating to a 
number of different regional crises.

Spain advocates a robust partnership bet-
ween the United Nations and regional orga-

nizations, particularly the African Union, and 
defends the role of regional peacekeeping 
operations in addressing conflicts in Africa. 
Spain and the EU supported Security Cou-
ncil resolution 2719 adopted in 2023 regar-
ding requests from the African Union Peace 
and Security Council to access UN assessed 
contributions for African Union-led peace 
support operations, which represents a signi-
ficant step forward in that direction. 

As regards the Sahel, a priority subregion, 
Spain considers that the protracted crisis in 
Libya represents a significant factor of ins-
tability. The volatile situation in that country 
and the porosity of its borders have facilita-
ted the activities of armed groups and tra-
ffickers of all kinds, heightening insecurity 
in the subregion, in particular in Mali, Niger, 
Burkina Faso, Sudan and Chad. 

Mindful of the magnitude of the challenge, 
Spain is committed to a proactive and future-
looking approach to tackling the destabiliza-
tion of the Sahel subregion as a result of the 
situation in Libya. Within the framework of 
the United Nations, Spain is working to foster 
stability in that country, lending its support 
to United Nations Security Council mediation 
initiatives and resolutions aimed at an inclu-
sive political solution as well as to the work of 
the Special Representative of the Secretary-
General for Libya and Head of the United 
Nations Support Mission in Libya (UNSMIL). 
Furthermore, Spain supports a number of 
peace and reconciliation processes by hea-
ding diplomatic and cooperation initiatives 
focused on disarmament, demobilization and 
reintegration. This approach has proven to 
be fundamental to achieving peace, stability 
and security in the Sahel. 

The meeting hosted by Spain in Toledo in 
May 2022 and attended by a number of Lib-
yan authorities and members of the 5+5 Joint 
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Military Commission, marked the launch of 
a comprehensive and coordinated strategy 
for strengthening regional stability. Spain is 
backing the establishment of similar forums 
to foster reconciliation between the east and 
the west.

Our goal is to contribute to lasting solutions 
that not only address security issues, but that 
also promote development and well-being in 
the Sahel, recognizing the need for strong in-
ternational backing and the adoption of spe-
cific and effective measures for the future. 

The Spanish Navy vessel “Relámpago” during its participation in the European Union initiative Coor-
dinated Maritime Presences, in the Gulf of Guinea. 
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Kofi Annan International Peacekeeping Trai-
ning Centre in Accra (Ghana) and the G5 Sahel 
Defence College of Nouakchott (Mauritania). 

Within the EU, Spain supported the contribu-
tion of 40 million euros to Mauritania for the 
G5 Sahel Defence College and the equipping 
of battalions on the border with Mali and the 
Sahel G5 joint force. In the context of the 
African Union Peace Facility, Spain also bac-
ked a European Peace Facility contribution of 
15 million euros to strengthen the capabilities 
of Mauritania’s armed forces.

Justice and security

In the sphere of justice and security, Spain 
manages a number of EU Delegated Coo-
peration projects aimed at combating te-
rrorism and serious crime, such as the CT 
Public Spaces project and the joint investi-
gation teams (JITs). These projects enable 
Spain to share with its African partners the 
knowledge and know-how accumulated 
from years of experience in maritime safety 
and in combating terrorism, organized cri-
me, disinformation and hybrid threats, and 
to acquire new knowledge from them, based 
on their experience.

As regards terrorism and organized crime, 
including trafficking in drugs, arms and hu-
man beings, Spain shares a number of simi-
lar (or identical) challenges and threats with 
key African neighbours. Africa’s security is 
our security, which is why cooperation with 
Africa forms part of our daily work. This 
cooperation is institutional, supportive and 
operational in nature and entails providing 
funding, equipment and training. In addi-
tion to bilateral actions, Spain is involved 
in EU projects in Africa such as the CT JUST 
project (involving multiple African coun-
tries), the A-TIPSOM project (Nigeria), the 
NORPREVSEC project (Ghana), the Common 
Operational Partnerships (COPs) of Mauri-
tania and Senegal and the NETCOP project 

(focused on establishing an operational net-
work between the different COPs and JITs in 
West Africa and the Sahel).

Within NATO, Spain promotes the moni-
toring of the decisions adopted at the Ma-
drid Summit of June 2022 and advocates the 
extension and intensification of dialogue 
and cooperation with the Southern Neigh-
bourhood through application of the action 
plan adopted at the 2024 NATO Summit in 
Washington, as well as support for the work 
of the Secretary General’s Special Represen-
tative for the Southern Neighbourhood, and 
closer collaboration between NATO and the 
EU in Africa.

Spain’s commitment to the Yaoundé Archi-
tecture for maritime safety and security in 
the Gulf of Guinea is reflected in its enga-
gement in programmes such as the Coordi-
nated Maritime Presences, promoted by the 
EU. Spain has contributed significantly to the 
fight against piracy through a notable parti-
cipation, since its launch, in the European 
Union Naval Force Operation ATALANTA 
(EUNAVFOR ATALANTA), carried out along 
the coast of Somalia. In this regard, Spain, 
which has the largest fishing fleet in the EU, 
attaches great importance to the fishing and 
energy resources of Africa’s seas and oceans. 

Another aspect of Spain’s cooperation in the 
sphere of defence is the Spanish-language 
training being provided to a number of Afri-
can military commanders to enable their 
participation in courses offered by our Ar-
med Forces in Spain.

Above all, Spain supports the African Pea-
ce and Security Architecture by supporting 
regional African mediation initiatives that 
seek to further solutions to the different re-
gional conflicts.
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Experience in migration 

Spain is a staunch advocate of safe, orderly 
and regular migration and will continue to 
promote comprehensive migration manage-
ment based on three pillars: tackling the root 
causes of forced migration by strengthening 
development programmes, especially aimed 
at young people; engaging in dialogue with 
our African partners in order to achieve safe, 
orderly and regular migration; and comba-
ting the criminal networks that foster irre-
gular migration and endanger human lives.

The Spanish approach to migration manage-
ment is characterized by being constructive 
and permanent. Given the intrinsically mul-
tidimensional nature of migration, constant 
coordination is maintained between those 
Spanish ministries whose responsibilities 
include matters relating to migration, with 
the Foreign Ministry paying particular at-
tention to the foreign dimension of migra-
tion through Spain’s network of embassies. 

The Office for Migration Affairs, within the 
State Secretariat for Foreign and Global 
Affairs, monitors data and reports on migra-
tion in international forums from a geostra-
tegic perspective. 

Cooperation and dialogue with our African 
partners is maintained both bilaterally and in 
the multilateral sphere. Together with those 
partners we are building and fortifying—in 
close collaboration with IOM and the Office 
of the United Nations High Commissioner 
for Refugees (UNHCR)—the human rights-
oriented multilateral international archi-
tecture that is crucial for safe, orderly and 
regular migration at the national, European 
and global levels.

With the aim of supporting efforts by African 
law enforcement agencies to dismantle hu-
man trafficking and people smuggling net-
works referred to above, the Ministry of the 

Interior has deployed a significant number 
of Spanish law enforcement officers to seve-
ral countries of origin and transit. 

Approximately 100 members of the National 
Police and Civil Guard are deployed at all ti-
mes in Mauritania, Senegal and The Gam-
bia, countries with which Spain enjoys close 
operational cooperation, with highly positi-
ve results. This deployment is strengthened 
whenever an increase is detected in the acti-
vity of such networks.

Of particular note in the bilateral sphere is 
the recent launch of a number of circular 
migration programmes with Mauritania, Se-
negal and The Gambia. Spain has substantial 
experience of managing this kind of pro-
gramme with other countries, such as Mo-
rocco, obtaining encouraging results.

Action in this sphere must show particular 
sensitivity towards countries of transit, such 
as Mauritania and Morocco, which are fa-
cing major flows of migration owing to eco-
nomic instability and internal conflicts. The 
significant pledges made by Spain and the 
EU to support Mauritania in addressing the 
migration and refugee crisis caused by the 
situation in Mali, are an example of this ap-
proach.
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MIGRATION

African communities account for 1,158,092 Spa-
nish residents, most of whom belong to the Mo-
roccan community (787,317). Despite Africa’s 
geographical proximity, the communities of 
citizens from Sub-Saharan countries in Spain 
are relatively small. According to the 2022 data 
collated by Spain’s National Statistics Institute 
(Spanish acronym: INE), the collective communi-
ty from Sub-Saharan Africa in Spain amounted 
to 261,976 people, representing just 4.73% of 
foreign residents. 

The vast majority of the members of this com-
munity are nationals of one of seven countries: 
Senegal (1.5%: the twentieth largest group of fo-
reign nationals in Spain); Nigeria (0.66%: thirty-
third); Mali (0.57%: thirty-fourth); The Gambia 
(0.42%: thirty-seventh); Ghana (0.37%: thirty-
ninth); Equatorial Guinea (0.22%: forty-eighth) 
and Guinea (0.20%: fifty-second).

According to a study conducted by Spain’s Mi-
nistry of Equality in 2020, 47% of people of Afri-
can descent in Spain were born in our country. 
The typical profile is that of a woman (62% of the 
total) with an average age of 31.9 years.

These communities represent a major asset for 
strengthening Spain’s relations with countries of 
origin. 

The European Commission has identified that 
63% of European small and medium-sized enter-
prises (SMEs) cannot find the talent they need in 
Europe owing to the demographic trends of our 
continent. Migration management is, therefore, 
a matter of common interest for Europeans and 
Africans alike, because of both to flows between 
Africa and Europe and to intra-African flows.

What are we currently doing? 

Over the past two decades, Spain has applied a 
comprehensive and balanced approach to mi-
gration, maintaining continuous dialogue with 
countries of origin and transit. 

This multidimensional approach—characteristic 
of Spain’s migration management—combines 
capacity-building in countries of origin and tran-
sit, sustainable development policies that tar-
get the root causes of migration and that seek 
to maximize its positive impact on countries 
and communities, the creation of legal chan-
nels for labour migration, efforts regarding vo-
luntary and forced return and readmission, and 
the fight against human trafficking and people 
smuggling networks. The purpose of all these 
efforts is to achieve safe, orderly and regular 
migration, pursuant to the Global Compact for 
Migration and the Global Compact on Refugees 
(both UN compacts), placing the human rights 
of migrants at the heart of our approach.

In the fight against the human trafficking and 
people smuggling networks that endanger hu-
man lives, Spain cooperates decisively with cou-
ntries of origin and transit on the basis of: (i) an 
awareness of a shared responsibility; (ii) mutual 
trust and joint and continuous operational colla-
boration; (iii) the provision of the technical resou-
rces needed to dismantle human trafficking and 
people smuggling networks; and (iv) the training 
of troops in African partner countries.

In this sphere, FIIAPP has considerable experien-
ce in the implementation of COP and JIT projects 
in Africa, whose objective is to build the capaci-
ties of public institutions for combatting human 
trafficking and people smuggling. Of particular 
significance in this area is the A-TIPSOM project 
in Nigeria, which focuses specifically on preven-
ting the trafficking and smuggling of women 
and girls.
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The Minister for Foreign Affairs, European Union and Cooperation in 2022 during his visit to the officers of 
the National Police and Civil Guard deployed to Dakar, Senegal, to combat human trafficking networks. 

In the current European demographic context, 
Spain is paying particular attention to the joint 
design, implementation and development with 
partner countries of projects for safe, orderly 
and regular labour migration. In addition to inter-
ministerial coordination, such initiatives also 
require public-private cooperation and coopera-
tion with civil society. 

In this sphere, FIIAPP is carrying out the Migra-
Safe project, whose purpose is to foster safe, 
orderly and regular migration by publicizing and 
promoting legal channels of migration to the EU. 
From a geographical perspective, it is important 
to support multi-country and multi-channel ap-
proaches, coordinating approaches and solu-
tions between countries of origin, transit and 
destination.

In 2022 Spain chaired the ministerial conference 
of the Rabat Process, the Euro-African platform 
for dialogue on migration co-created by Spain in 
2006. This conference, held in Cádiz, concluded 
with the approval of a Political Declaration and 

Action Plan structured around the five priority 
domains of the Joint Valletta Action Plan adop-
ted at the Valletta Summit on Migration between 
EU and African leaders in 2015. 

Within the EU, the determined efforts of the re-
cent Spanish Presidency of the Council of the EU 
achieved the adoption of the EU Pact on Migra-
tion and Asylum, which is based on the principles 
of solidarity and co-responsibility. 

The persistence of discriminatory, xenophobic 
and racist attitudes and behaviours calls for 
the strengthening of interventions at all levels, 
including in education, public narrative and the 
response from law enforcement, paying particu-
lar attention to the prevention and prosecution 
of hate speech crimes. Instruments such as the 
Spanish Observatory on Racism and Xenophobia 
(OBERAXE), attached to the State Secretariat 
for Migration, contribute to that goal with social 
impact campaigns and initiatives.
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Commitment to defending the 
rights of the most vulnerable 

DEMOCRACY, FEMINIST 
FOREIGN POLICY AND 
DIVERSITY

What are we currently doing?

Spain supports the development of democra-
tic institutions in Africa through capacity-buil-
ding projects, contributions to UNDP to sup-
port electoral processes and through projects 
aimed at consolidating human rights in Africa.

Spain promotes and supports initiatives 
championing LGBTI people, both through our 
support for civil society organizations and 
through our participation and leadership in 
organizations such as the Equal Rights Coa-
lition.

Spain’s feminist foreign policy is aimed at 
achieving full equality between men and wo-
men and the empowerment of women and 
girls both in Africa and in the rest of the world. 

There has been recent progress on the conti-
nent with respect to the empowerment of wo-
men (equality laws; greater equality of repre-
sentation, with women holding almost a third 
of seats in 11 African national parliaments; clo-
sing of the gender gap in primary education). 
According to a 2020 report by UN-Women, the 
average Africa Gender Index score for 2019 
was 48.6%. Nevertheless, discrimination and 
inequality persist at many levels.

To address this situation:

•	 Spanish Cooperation has gender equali-
ty and the empowerment of women and 
girls as priorities and these issues have 
been included in specific programmes 
and mainstreamed into all of Spain’s coo-
peration activities.

•	 Spain is supporting policies in different 
countries championing gender equali-
ty and the empowerment of women and 
girls.

•	 Spain supports the inclusion of ambitious 
gender equality goals as a policymaking 
priority in the EU and in the multilateral 
system.

•	 Spain is fostering initiatives that favour 
female leadership in both business and 
politics.

•	 Spain is also fostering ties between 
women’s collectives and associations in 
Spain and in Africa.

Spain’s embassies in our African partner cou-
ntries meet regularly with women’s organiza-
tions that share their experiences, challenges 
and milestones, with a view to guiding Spain’s 
action in this area. 

In all its high-level communications with its 
African partners, and through the implemen-
tation of its projects, Spain reaffirms its com-
mitment to the political, economic and social 
empowerment of women and the eradication
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The President of the Government delivers a speech at the conference organized by the Women for Africa 
Foundation in Madrid in May 2022 entitled “Women as bridge builders. Proposals from the South for 
global change.”

of all forms of violence, including sexual violence 
in armed conflicts. 

At the multilateral level, Spain has worked with a 
number of African partners to promote the rights 
of women and girls, including in the Feminist Fo-
reign Policy Plus (FFP+) Group and in the Global 
Partnership for Action on Gender-based Online 
Harassment and Abuse. 

Also of great importance to Spain are the rights of 
people with disabilities, in particular women and 
girls, as well as accessibility and inclusive educa-
tion.

Inclusive education is vital to overcoming the 
difficulties faced by people with disabilities in 
Africa due to stigma and the negative perception 
of children with disabilities, often aggravated by 
factors such as gender, type of disability and de-
gree of dependence. Such education is also es-
sential to full recognition of the rights of children 
with disabilities.
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Commitment to a just digital 
transition as part of the  
process of building an inclusive, 
equitable and sustainable  
society

In the twenty-first century, internet access 
has become an essential right, crucial to equal 
opportunities and progress in terms of edu-
cation, livelihoods and professional skills, 
which are key to human development. Spain 
will maintain its commitment to the global di-
gital transition, as reflected in its support for 
multilateral actions such as the Giga Initia-
tive launched by UNICEF and the Internatio-
nal Telecommunication Union (ITU), which 
aims to connect every school in the world to 
the internet by 2030. In Sub-Saharan Africa, 
this initiative has worked with Rwanda, Ken-
ya, Sierra Leone, Niger and Zimbabwe, map-
ping 280,000 schools and connecting 1,500 
schools and 630,000 students and teachers. 
Spain’s support includes the establishment of 
the Giga Technology Centre in Barcelona. 

Together in the ecological 
transition, environmental 
cooperation and the fight 
against climate change

According to the World Meteorological Or-
ganization (WMO), in 2022 more than 110 
million people in Africa were directly affec-
ted by weather, climate and water-related 
hazards causing economic damages amoun-
ting to more than 7.7 billion euros and 5,000 
fatalities. 

The ecological transition is therefore a key 
priority for the continent, as made clear at 
the Africa Climate Summit held in Nairobi 
in September 2023.

The successful completion of the ecological 
transition requires appropriation of suffi-
cient funds. At COP28 in Dubai (2023), the 

operationalization of the Loss and Damage 
Fund, with an initial capitalization of 715 
million euros, represented a significant step 
forward in terms of addressing vulnerabili-
ty to climate change. Spain has committed 
to supporting this fund with a contribution 
of 20 million euros. Spain is also one of 
the main contributors to the Kyoto Proto-
col Adaptation Fund, with adaptation to the 
impacts of climate change being a priority 
for African countries.

Also of note was the launch of the Santia-
go Network, conceived at COP25 in Madrid 
(2019) as a means of catalysing technical as-
sistance to minimize and address loss and 
damage in countries that are particularly 
vulnerable to the adverse effects of climate 
change. Spain, to date has made a contribu-
tion of 7 million euros to this Network.

In addition, Spain has for years been sup-
porting global efforts on adaptation to the 
impacts of climate change, paying particular 
attention to the Kyoto Protocol Adaptation 
Fund, to which it has contributed more than 
130 million euros since 2010. 

The vulnerability of African small island 
developing States to the impacts of climate 
change must also be taken into account.

IDRA, launched by Spain and Senegal at 
COP27 in Sharm el-Sheikh (2022), is the 
first world coalition dedicated to mobilizing 
political capital and financial and technical 
resources for a drought-resilient future. At 
COP28, the number of members increased to 
36 countries and 28 organizations.   
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Principles: 5 goals and 
100 lines of action

The analysis in this strategy of the opportu-
nities offered by the current situation as part 
of a renewed relationship between Spain and 
Africa—in the light of current capabilities—
and of the multiple challenges that exist, 
shows how far we have come since formu-
lating our first Plan Africa strategies at the 
beginning of this century.

Understanding of the continent, awareness 
of points of interdependence, and the range 
of political, economic, cooperation and se-
curity instruments available to respond to 
the shared needs of Spaniards and Africans, 
within the broadest framework of EU-Africa 
relations, have grown considerably, but so 
too has the complexity of the challenges to 
be overcome. An additional consideration is 
the presence of third countries with interests 
and values that are not always compatible 
with our own.

5

African Union headquarters, Ethiopia.
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On the basis of this analysis, it can be con-
cluded that the close partnership between 
Spain and Africa still has potential for deve-
lopment in all spheres. This partnership has 
become a strategic need for our country and 
for a good number of our African partners.

For Spain, this strategic need stems from 
our country’s particular geopolitical confi-
guration, from our position as Africa’s Eu-
ropean neighbour, and from demographic, 
economic, socio-political and environmental 
considerations concerning Africa. The com-
bined sum of these factors calls for more de-
termined and systematic collaboration with 
our African partners to create shared oppor-
tunities and to be prepared for the harmful 
impacts of the challenges described.

For Spain, a prosperous and peaceful Afri-
can neighbourhood is not just one more goal 
among many; rather, it must be identified 
as a true strategic policy priority for Spain, 
and be cemented as such for a long period 
of time.

This section of the Strategy sets out clear 
goals and lines of action which, being broadly 
shared and achievable, will get us closer to 
where we need to be in terms of mutual un-
derstanding, joint influence in making the 
decisions that most directly affect us, and 

impact on the ground. Only in this way can 
Spain contribute to meeting the stability, 
prosperity, development and democracy as-
pirations of African societies, whose fulfil-
ment is also in the best interests of Spain and 
the EU.

The expressions “strengthening”, 
“growing”, “connecting”, “protecting” and 
“living together” have been chosen to refer 
in very broad terms to the strategic goals of 
Spain’s policy with respect to the govern-
ments, societies and citizens of our neigh-
bouring continent. They constitute the 
“what?” of the Strategy, and encompass a 
set of more specific proposals and initiatives 
that will facilitate the monitoring and eva-
luation of its application.

However, experience has taught us that in 
international relations the “how?” is as 
important as the “what?” and the “how 
much?”. As an Atlantic and Mediterranean 
country, and as Africa’s neighbour in Europe, 
Spain is convinced that in the twenty-first 
century its relationship with Africa must 
necessarily be a partnership based on con-
tinuous dialogue and on mutual respect and 
benefit, drawing on bilateral mechanisms 
and the opportunities offered by interre-
gional (EU-AU) relations and the multilate-
ral system. Because they are indispensable, 
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these characteristics constitute principles as 
well as distinguishing features of Spain’s co-
llaboration with Africa, whose purpose is to 
facilitate relationships based on mutual trust 
and benefit.

1.
STRENGTHENING 

Strategic goal: a Hispano-African relation-
ship that consolidates and expands reci-
procal understanding and dialogue and fa-
cilitates joint action

1.1. Increase our high-level 
interaction with African 
partners, especially with West 
Africa and North Africa 

	> Spain will propose holding high-level 
meetings with a larger number of African 
countries, selected according to the num-
ber of shared interests and opportunities. 
The agendas of these high-level meetings 
will include the political, economic, de-
velopment, migration and security mat-
ters that Spain and its African counterpart 
jointly identify with a view to advancing 
the goals of the partnership and of con-
veying to the respective economic, social 
and institutional stakeholders the support 
for the prioritization of bilateral coopera-
tion. Efficient mechanisms, such as sec-
toral working groups, will be adopted to 
monitor and implement the commitments 
adopted. 

This form of working is proposed because 
of the usefulness of establishing a more 
technical structure for sectoral working 
groups, in which action plans are defined 
for each respective area. Periodic mee-
tings will enable us to jointly complete 

an entire project cycle encompassing the 
identification, preparation, implementa-
tion and evaluation stages.

	> The ministers with a particular involve-
ment with Africa, in addition to the Fo-
reign Minister, will increase the frequen-
cy of their contact in order to assure our 
African partners of Spain’s interest in 
maintaining broad-reaching and balanced 
relations including bilateral meetings held 
on the side-lines of international sum-
mits. 

	> Efforts will be made to ensure that Spain 
is duly represented at the swearing-in ce-
remonies of elected African leaders, which 
shall be attended by His Majesty The King, 
by the Speaker of the Congress of Deputies 
or of the Senate, or by ministers or state 
secretaries, as the case may be. 

	> The political consultations already held at 
the level of the State Secretary for Fore-
ign and Global Affairs with certain coun-
tries will be extended to include additional 
African partners. Matters of interest to the 
African continent will regularly be inclu-
ded in political consultations with the EU 
and third countries. 

1.2. Strengthen dialogue 
and collaboration with the 
AU and with other regional 
organizations, in particular 
ECOWAS

	> As an expression of support for regional 
integration processes, Spain will intensi-
fy its institutional-level political dialogue 
with the AU and ECOWAS, and will hold 
periodic consultations with the Intergo-
vernmental Authority on Development 
(IGAD), SADC and the Economic Com-
munity of Central African States (EC-
CAS). Spain will consult with the African 
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Union Commission and with the ECOWAS 
Commission regarding the possibility of 
holding biennial high-level meetings to 
promote the lines of work defined in exis-
ting bilateral mechanisms (the 2022 Me-
morandum of Understanding on Political 
Dialogue and Sectoral Collaboration with 
the AU; the 2009 Abuja Declaration and 
the 2023 Memorandum of Understanding 
on Political Consultations with ECOWAS) 
or soon to be approved (renewed pro-
gramme of Spain-ECOWAS cooperation), 
and to extend them into other areas of 
mutual interest. 

	> The Member States of the Community of 
Portuguese-speaking Countries (Portu-
guese acronym: CPLP), of which Spain has 
been an Associated Observer State since 
the Luanda Summit of 2021, share special 
historical and cultural ties with our coun-
try. Spain will continue to pay special at-
tention to these countries, with which we 
will work to identify projects on which to 
collaborate.

	> Encouraged by the good results obtained, 
Spain will maintain its collaboration with 
AUDA-NEPAD through AECID and will 
present a new cooperation programme for 
the coming years, focused on creating op-
portunities for women and young people.

	> Spain will continue to promote the 5+5 
Dialogue meetings, in order to strengthen 
and increase the cooperation opportuni-
ties it offers. 

	> Spain will foster the exchange of officials 
for short stays and will continue training 
programmes with ECOWAS.

1.3. A bigger, more dynamic role 
for Spain in EU-African relations 

	> Due to its geopolitical position and its clo-
se ties with the African continent, Spain 
aims to play a greater role in strengthe-
ning EU relations with Africa. To this end, 
Spain will seek to ensure that the priori-
ty attributed by the EU to the relations-
hip with the African continent results in 
the effective implementation of the com-
mitments adopted in 2022 at the Sixth EU-
AU Summit and is reflected in the agendas 
of the EU institutions and in particular of 
the Council of the EU, as during the recent 
Spanish Presidency (second half of 2023).

	> Spain will take into account and highlight 
the interests of the continent in debates 
and decision-making processes in the 
EU on policies affecting Africa (new rules 
for investment promotion and protection 
agreements, revision of SFPAs).

	> We will work with our African partners to 
improve the identification and implemen-
tation of projects that are eligible for EU 
funding through different mechanisms, 
such as the Neighbourhood, Development 
and International Cooperation Instrument 
(NDICI), International Partnerships, the 
Global Gateway and Team Europe initia-
tives (TEIs).

	> On the basis of the shared strategic goals 
and positions reflected in the EU-AU de-
claration “A Joint Vision for 2030”, Spain 
will contribute to closer dialogue and 
coordination between the EU and Africa in 
multilateral forums.

	> The situation in Africa, and especially in 
North Africa, the Sahel and West Africa, 
will feature in the regular communica-
tions between Spain and the President 
of the European Commission and the EU 
High Representative for Foreign Affairs 



67

and Security Policy, thus ensuring that 
Spanish interests and perspectives are 
decisive in EU policy-making concerning 
Africa. To this end, internal and inter-
ministerial coordination will be improved.

	> Spain will make greater use of individual 
and joint position documents on African 
affairs for Council meetings of all configu-
rations. In addition, efforts will be made 
to increase the presence of Spanish civil 
servants in the units that design and im-
plement policies on Africa, both in Brus-
sels and in EU Delegations on the ground. 
The relationships of our embassies with 
EU Delegations on the ground will also be 
strengthened.

	> Spain will work to foster triangular rela-
tionships between Africa, Ibero-America 
and Europe in the economic, cultural and 
development spheres, focusing on our 
common interests as continents bordering 
the Atlantic Ocean, as well as triangular 
Euro-Arab-African cooperation, open to 
any countries interested, and carried out 
in close association with partners such as 
Morocco and Egypt.  

	> Efforts will be made to increase collabo-
ration on the ground with third-country 
embassies and between the latter and EU 
Delegations and accredited Member Sta-
tes. The Foreign Ministry will undertake 
specific monitoring of this matter, as well 
as of the “country-team” mechanism es-
tablished, at Director-General level. Ini-
tiatives of this kind have already been 
carried out with Mauritania, and could 
be extended to other countries of the 
Maghreb and West Africa.

1.4. Strengthen our inter-
ministerial and inter-territorial 
coordination of policies with 
Africa

	> To favour inter-ministerial coordination, 
the Foreign Ministry will seek to create 
an inter-ministerial committee for Africa, 
which will hold biannual meetings at mi-
nisterial level, chaired by the Minister of 
Foreign Affairs, European Union and Coo-
peration, and quarterly meetings at the 
State Secretary level, chaired by the State 
Secretary for Foreign and Global Affairs. 
This committee will monitor the imple-
mentation of this Strategy and update it 
as necessary.

	> The Foreign Ministry will propose a sche-
dule of ministerial trips and visits to 
African countries and organizations, to 
be made at least on a quarterly basis, to 
maintain a sustained and balanced dia-
logue with our African partners, in par-
ticular with the countries of North Africa 
and West Africa. In preparing for these 
trips, the Foreign Ministry will continue 
to compile the assessments, priorities 
and expectations of companies, coopera-
tion stakeholders and civil society orga-
nizations with interests in the country in 
question..

1.5. Greater guidance and 
training on the complexity of 
African affairs

	> The Foreign Ministry will establish an 
Africa advisory committee, comprising 
eminent African public figures from key 
professions, and ensuring that all the cul-
tural, geographical and language areas 
of particular interest for Spain are duly 
represented. At its annual meetings, the 
Africa advisory committee will convey ex-
pectations and demands, and will be up-
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dated, in turn, on the policies implemen-
ted by Spain with its African partners.  

	> The role of the Africa Round Table will be 
strengthened as a forum specifically de-
dicated to dialogue between Spain’s Cen-
tral Administration and non-government 
organizations, the business sector and 
the scientific and academic spheres. This 
forum will be invited to collaborate more 
closely on the development of specific ini-
tiatives and proposals, in particular those 
involving civil society stakeholders.

	> Work with the African diaspora(s) in Spain 
will be intensified, integrating their crite-
ria into the process of defining our fore-
ign policy, maximizing the impetus from 
the meeting of the African diaspora(s) and 
African civil society, Building bridges bet-
ween Africa and Spain, held in May 2024, 
which was the starting point for formal 
dialogue and collaboration between the 
community, experts and the Administra-
tion. Connections between this and other 
similar initiatives will be promoted in the 
European and Latin American spheres.

	> The Diplomatic School of Spain will ap-
point a specific official to oversee its coo-
peration with Africa and will programme 
training activities on African affairs for 
staff of the Foreign Ministry seconded to 
Africa, open to staff from other ministries. 
This training will focus on the priorities 
set out in this Strategy, both in its bila-
teral aspect and its European and multi-
lateral aspects. Within its sphere of ac-
tion, the Diplomatic School of Spain will 
maintain communications with its African 
counterparts regarding the possibility of 
carrying out programmes of collaboration 
of mutual interest.

	> The different Spanish public administra-
tions, at national, regional and local le-
vels, in collaboration with academic and 

research institutions and the private sector 
will undertake diverse efforts to increase 
knowledge about Africa. As part of this, all 
the activities carried out by said adminis-
trations in relation to African affairs will 
be mapped. 

1.6. Enhance our diplomatic 
capabilities in Spain 

	> In line with this Strategy’s prioritization of 
West Africa, a Deputy Directorate-General 
for West Africa and the Sahel will be created 
within the Directorate-General for Africa. 
The unit will be responsible for promoting 
bilateral relations with the countries of the 
subregion and with ECOWAS and other re-
gional bodies, and will contribute to the 
design of proposals and initiatives tailored 
to the specific circumstances of this subre-
gion.

	> Synergies and mutual support between Casa 
África, Casa Árabe and Casa Mediterráneo 
will be encouraged.

	> Focal points for African affairs will be ap-
pointed at certain Spanish embassies in 
non-African countries.

1.7. Increase our presence on the 
ground

	> Spain will strengthen its institutional de-
ployment in Africa by opening new embas-
sies and creating new subsidiary diploma-
tic offices and sectoral offices, including 
Spanish Cooperation offices. In addition, 
the Embassy in Nigeria will be furnished 
with new offices and the Embassy in Libya 
will be reopened.

	> Efforts will also be made to strengthen the 
Spanish Cooperation offices for West Africa 
and the Sahel so that they can assume a 



69

regional role, expanding its work to coun-
tries such as Guinea-Bissau and The Gam-
bia. Consideration will also be given to the 
possibility of strengthening the Spanish 
Cooperation office in Nigeria (to increa-
se bilateral work with Nigeria, Ghana and 
Côte d'Ivoire, in particular in the sphere of 
financial cooperation), as well as the offi-
ces in Ethiopia..

	> In accordance with the prioritization of 
West Africa and the Sahel provided for in 
the GSSDC Act, Spanish Cooperation will 
define a new Strategy for Africa. Additio-
nally, efforts will be made to strengthen 
Spanish Cooperation instruments on the 
continent. These efforts will focus on fi-
nancial cooperation (with operations in 
more African countries, prioritizing West 
Africa) and on humanitarian action (which 
Spain must continue to expand, to cover 
the entire fragile strip extending from the 
Horn of Africa to the Atlantic Coast).

	> Participation of all stakeholders: Given the 
geographical proximity of Spain to Africa, 
and the ever-growing population of Afri-
can nationals in Spain, the consolidation 
of Hispano-African relations must inclu-
de key stakeholders that are most closely 
linked to the continent, as well as figu-
res from the world of business, academia, 
sports, and civil society. 

2.
GROWING

Strategic goal: sustainable development in 
Africa favoured by the involvement of Spa-
nish institutions, companies and organiza-
tions

2.1. More training to help African 
youth find decent work

	> Spain will establish dialogues, partners-
hips and support for African youth to con-
tribute to the development of our partner 
countries and as a distinguishing featu-
re of this new Strategy, favouring formal 
employment and decent work. 

	> In addition, a foundation will be establis-
hed to foster relations with Africa and to 
create academic and employment oppor-
tunities for young people through study 
grant and visitor programmes.

	> Spain, in consultation with its Afri-
can partners, will foster the creation of 
new Spanish schools and bilingual de-
partments, support vocational training 
centres, foreign action educational re-
source centres, AECID workshop schools 
and the ACERCA capacity-building and 
training programme in the cultural sec-
tor, to help address the misalignment 
between the training and skills of the la-
bour force—in particular those of young 
people—and the training and skills nee-
ded for production transformation and the 
ongoing ecological and digital transitions.  

	> Spain will increase its support for program-
mes teaching skills related to entrepreneur-
ship and the optimal use of new technolo-
gies, and promotion of the social economy, 
consulting with business organizations and 
trade unions in Spain and in African cou-
ntries on the design of these programmes.

	> On the basis of the experience with study 
grant programmes for African students, 
such as the Africa-MED and ASALE pro-
grammes (organized by AECID), the Ca-
nary Islands-Africa programme (regional 
administration of the Canary Islands), 
the Learn Africa programme (Women for 
Africa Foundation), and the EU Erasmus+ 
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programme, all of which offer training 
opportunities in Spain to young African 
professionals and researchers, allocations 
for study grant programmes and assis-
tantships will be increased to amounts 
closer to those of countries such as Ger-
many, France, Japan and China.  

	> Spain will consider repeating the Raisa 
visitors’ programme for African women 
leaders, in particular in those areas iden-
tified as priorities in this Strategy and in 
the 2030 Agenda and the Agenda 2063, 
paying particular attention to the ecologi-
cal, digital and social transitions.

	> Spain will continue to collaborate actively 
to provide training to labour administra-
tions and to promote decent work and oc-
cupational health and safety, as well as in 
the sphere of the social and solidarity eco-
nomy, agreeing bilateral and multilateral 
instruments, contributing to pertinent in-
ternational bodies, and involving experts 
from the Central Administration and civil 
society in cooperation programmes.

2.2. Increase our contribution 
to Global Gateway projects in 
Africa

	> The different ministries with responsibili-
ties in this area will promote the mobiliza-
tion of the various instruments supporting 
sustainable investment (including Spanish 
financial cooperation) to foster their deploy-
ment in Africa. Moreover, Spain will encou-
rage the participation of Spanish investors 
and guide Spanish companies towards those 
Global Gateway projects that are of special 
interest for Spain in all stages of their de-
finition and implementation, in particular 
those focused on renewable energy and the 
ecological transition, water and sanitation, 
public works, agro-industry, air and 

rail transport, engineering and consultancy, 
telecommunications and digitalization.  

	> Spain’s embassies in Africa and their secto-
ral offices, including Spanish Cooperation 
offices and economic and trade offices, will 
pay particular attention to monitoring the 
implementation of Global Gateway projects 
and, in general, of the EU-AU declaration 
“A Joint Vision for 2030” in their countries 
of accreditation, collaborating closely with 
EU Delegations and maintaining their cen-
tral services duly informed.

	> The Permanent Representation of Spain to 
the EU will be strengthened with staff from 
the working groups on African affairs, de-
velopment and the Global Gateway stra-
tegy. In addition, seminars will be held 
by sector and by country in collaboration 
with the Ministry of Economy, Trade and 
Enterprise, the Ministry for the Ecological 
Transition and the Demographic Challen-
ge and the Ministry of Transport and Sus-
tainable Mobility, the Spanish Chamber of 
Commerce, the Spanish Confederation of 
Business Organizations (Spanish acronym: 
CEOE), the Spanish Exporters and Inves-
tors Club, the Spanish Export Credit Agen-
cy (Spanish acronym: CESCE) and COFIDES 
(a state-owned enterprise specialized in 
the management of State funds that pro-
vides medium and long-term financing for 
private investments linked to different pu-
blic policy purposes), among others.

2.3. Strengthen financial 
support for Spanish investment 
in Africa

	> The recently created “Alianza África 
Avanza” will channel the support of all 
stakeholders, financial instruments and 
initiatives in the region to optimize their 
use and ensure that their impact on the 
continent is as beneficial as possible. The 
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aim of this alliance is to establish a stable 
and flexible common strategic framework 
that maximizes the impact of investments 
on economic development and social pro-
gress, especially in West Africa, in sectors 
with particular capacity for generating job 
opportunities, such as telecommunica-
tions, finance, agricultural transforma-
tion, tourism and infrastructure.

	> New financial packages will be coordina-
ted, modelled on the support package for 
investment in the ecological transition in 
South Africa, aimed both at specific coun-
tries and at regions and paying particular 
attention to the needs of West African and 
North African countries.

	> The coordination and coherence of the 
financial instruments managed by the 
Ministry of Economy, Trade and Enter-
prise will be strengthened with Spanish 
Cooperation instruments such as the new 
Spanish Sustainable Development Fund 
(Spanish acronym: FEDES), and Spain’s 
previous Development Fund (Spanish 
acronym: FONPRODE), maintaining the 
purpose and nature of each instrument, 
and risk coverage for Spanish companies 
wishing to carry out business operations 
in Africa will be expanded through CESCE. 

	> Collaboration on projects with the priva-
te sector will be pursued, in the form of 
public-private partnerships, placing par-
ticular emphasis on capacity-building and 
the training of local senior management 
staff, and new co-financing initiatives 
with international financial institutions 
will be actively promoted..

	> Lines of financing will be extended to 
companies, making resources available 
to Spanish companies to facilitate inves-
tment through grants and loans, such as 
the new Spain-Morocco Financial Proto-
col or the Corporate Internationalization 

Fund (Spanish acronym: FIEM) line of 
credit announced for Mauritania in Fe-
bruary 2024. 

2.4. Improve information and 
legal frameworks to facilitate 
investment

	> Spain will devote more effort to facilita-
ting mutual understanding between Spa-
nish and African entrepreneurs, promo-
ting initiatives such as business forums 
and trade missions.

	> Given that insufficient knowledge of our 
respective economies discourages inves-
tment and trade, Spain will redouble its 
efforts, through business organizations 
and chambers of commerce, to ensure 
that Spanish and African economic ope-
rators have complete, up-to-date and 
reliable information on aspects affecting 
their businesses, including current legal 
frameworks. In addition, an Ibero-Afri-
can association of chambers of commerce 
(AFRICO) will be created.

	> Spanish companies will be fully informed 
about existing support tools for inves-
tment, such as the Platform on Inves-
tment and Productive Transformation in 
Africa developed jointly by the OECD (of 
which Spain is a member) and the African 
Union.

	> Furthermore, Spain will continue to pro-
mote regulatory harmonization and the 
adoption of rules, agreements and stan-
dards that facilitate trade with Africa and 
investment in the continent. In this re-
gard, work will be undertaken to conclude 
new agreements on the reciprocal promo-
tion and protection of investments and to 
prevent double taxation.
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	> Spain will actively support OECD collabo-
ration programmes with the aim of incor-
porating African countries as Organisation 
members when they meet the conditions 
for accession. Spain will also support the 
Middle East and North Africa (MENA) 
Programme.

2.5. Greater Spanish 
involvement in new financing for 
development and debt relief for 
Africa 

	> Spain will work closely with its African 
partners to ensure that the Fourth Inter-
national Conference on Financing for De-
velopment, to be held in Spain in 2025, 
results in more substantial, more pre-
dictable and more sustainable develop-
ment finance for Africa. Spain will also 
seek progress as regards the efficiency of 
the assistance provided, the mobilization 
of domestic resources, international tax 
cooperation and the fight against corrup-
tion and trafficking.

	> In addition, Spain will join the high-level 
working group on the global financial ar-
chitecture created within the framework 
of the United Nations Economic Commis-
sion for Africa (ECA) to make this archi-
tecture more effective and better suited to 

the development needs of African coun-
tries.

	> Appropriate proposals for debt relief, res-
tructuring and conversion will be suppor-
ted, both bilaterally and within the fra-
mework of multilateral forums.

	> Spain raised its pledge to channel up to 
50% of its 2021 SDR allocation and will 
encourage other countries to commit to 
increasing their allocations as well, in 
addition to favouring their innovative use 
to fund sustainable development. 

	> To strengthen borrowers’ resilience and 
facilitate debt restructuring, Spain will 
promote the inclusion of collective action 
clauses in loan agreements and bonds. 
Creditors will also be encouraged to in-
clude contingency clauses in loan agre-
ements, which will allow for the tempo-
rary suspension of payments when faced 
with events that have a critical impact 
on the balance of payments and on the 
borrower’s repayment capacity. Spain will 
encourage the application of these clauses 
in its new repayable sovereign-guaran-
teed financing agreements for low- and 
low-middle-income countries.

	> Spain advocates improving implementa-
tion of the G20 Common Framework for 
debt treatments beyond the Debt Service 

The Maguga Dam in Swaziland.
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Suspension Initiative in order to streamli-
ne debt restructuring processes and to ex-
tend its scope to middle-income countries 
not currently included in the initiative.

	> Spain will promote reform of multilate-
ral development banks so that they can 
guarantee that concessional financing is 
primarily extended to the poorest coun-
tries and for the provision of global public 
goods such as the fight against climate 
change or pandemics. Spain will also fos-
ter the channelling of SDRs through mul-
tilateral development banks.

	> Tax reforms will be promoted (enabling 
tax systems to make more financial re-
sources available) to make systems more 
progressive, transparent and effective, 
supported by appropriate technical tra-
ining and advances in international tax 
cooperation. To this end, Spain participa-
ted actively in the definition of terms of 
reference for a UN framework convention 
on international taxation and will conti-
nue to foster negotiations for its prepa-
ration.

	> As an essential complement to conces-
sional financing, Spain will foster priva-
te financing, together with the necessary 
regulation to ensure it is in line with the 
SDGs and that it produces significant de-
velopment impacts. Ownership at the na-
tional level will also be promoted.

2.6. Increase Spain’s 
contribution to the development 
of transport, energy, water 
and digital infrastructure. 
Electrification

	> To help reduce the logistics and trans-
port costs that hinder the effective econo-
mic integration of the African continent, 
as envisaged by the States Parties to the 

African Continental Free Trade Area Agre-
ement, Spain will encourage its companies 
and institutions to participate in strategic 
projects that promote connectivity and 
digitalization within Africa.

	> Spain will also focus investments on in-
creasing connectivity between Africa and 
Spain, whether bilaterally, through the 
Global Gateway or in collaboration with 
other partners, by means of initiatives for 
green hydrogen and strategic corridors. 
The possibility of establishing more direct 
flights between Spain and Africa will also 
be studied, in particular with countries of 
West Africa and with airports that are re-
gional hubs.

	> Spain will encourage its energy compa-
nies to rise to the challenge of electrifying 
the continent, with a focus on renewable 
energy and with special interest in self-
supply systems and improving access to 
energy in remote areas, in order to over-
come the severe deficit in the latter res-
pect, which hinders economic transfor-
mation and limits the well-being of the 
population.

	> Spain will promote economic develop-
ment, and internationalization and com-
petitiveness of innovative companies by 
fostering thematic networks and strategic 
R&D&I projects, with special attention to 
priority areas of action such as renewa-
ble energy, microgrids, storage, the envi-
ronment and water treatment and puri-
fication. Support will be given to Spanish 
participation in public-private partners-
hips for the design and implementation of 
transport networks in Africa, particularly 
those involving conventional and high-
speed railway infrastructure, in line with 
the Agenda 2063 flagship project for the 
creation of an African Integrated High 
Speed Railway Network.
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	> Support will also be provided for the de-
velopment of air and port navigation fa-
cilities and satellite surveillance services.

	> Spain will continue to promote the human 
right to access to safe drinking water and 
sanitation, the effective exercise of which 
is an indispensable condition for the en-
joyment of other rights such as the rights 
to health, education and food. Spanish 
Cooperation will undertake a new line of 
work focused on water resources, within 
the framework of the new Masar Al’an 
strategy for the Arab world.

2.7. Greater Spanish involvement 
in the development of the 
tourism sector in Africa

	> As a world leader in the tourism sector, 
Spain will invite its African partners to 
sign memorandums of understanding to 
facilitate the transfer of knowledge, ex-
perience and good practices, to provide 
technical assistance and the exchange of 
experts in the field.

	> Spain will seek to ensure that the needs 
of the African tourism sector are given 
greater consideration in the agenda of 
the World Tourism Organization, based in 
Spain.

	> The activities of Spanish companies in 
the African tourism sector will be fostered 
through incentives and support program-
mes, as will those of African companies in 
the Spanish tourism sector. In this regard, 
Spain will make an institutional effort to 
strengthen and increase the Spanish pre-
sence at major tourism fairs and events.

	> Spanish Cooperation will support sus-
tainable cultural routes, in collaboration 
with UNESCO and other organizations. 

3.
CONNECTING

Strategic goal: closer ties between the so-
cieties and economies of Africa, Spain and 
the world

3.1. Migration that is safer, 
and more orderly, regular and 
mutually beneficial

	> Spain will continue to promote compre-
hensive migration management, through 
three fundamental approaches: addres-
sing the root causes of irregular migra-
tion by strengthening development pro-
grammes, especially those aimed at young 
people; fostering safe, orderly and regular 
migration; and combating human traffic-
king and people smuggling.

	> Spain will lead efforts to strengthen part-
nerships between countries of origin, 
transit and destination, especially within 
the framework of initiatives such as the 
Rabat Process and in line with the conclu-
sions of the Ministerial Conference held in 
Cádiz in December 2022.

	> Dialogues and cooperation agreements on 
migration will be strengthened and ex-
panded with a comprehensive, integrated 
approach, especially with our partners in 
West Africa and the Maghreb. Collabora-
tion will be strengthened in the area of 
training for safer and more orderly mi-
gration management and in the fight aga-
inst people smuggling networks.

	> The geographic scope of circular migra-
tion programmes will continue to be ex-
panded, with the inclusion of The Gambia 
and Mauritania, among other countries, 
while existing programmes with coun-
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tries such as Morocco and Senegal will be 
expanded. Moreover, Talent Partnerships 
will be fostered and voluntary return pro-
grammes will be improved.

	> Spain will work to improve its consular 
services in Africa, to provide better assis-
tance to Spanish citizens and better ser-
vice to Africans and others in visa proce-
dures.

	> In collaboration with countries of origin 
and transit, the fight against irregular im-
migration and people smuggling will be 
continued, prioritizing preventive strate-
gies.

3.2. Create more instruments 
to promote contact and mutual 
understanding 

	> Exchanges of knowledge and increased co-
llaboration between Spanish and African 
scholars and scientists will be facilitated 
through agreements between the relevant 
public bodies, including universities and 
other educational and research centres. 
Collaboration at the doctoral level will be 
further encouraged. 

	> Work will be done to establish new Coun-
cil Foundations for Spain’s major African 
partners, modelled on those for other cou-
ntries.

	> The public diplomacy capacities of ins-
titutions such as Casa África, Casa Árabe 
and Casa Mediterráneo will be strengthe-
ned, with greater coordination of the Ca-
sas. Furthermore, more initiatives will be 
undertaken, building on the Africa Visi-
tors Programme and the ECOWAS Training 
Programme, to contribute to better mutual 
understanding and appreciation.

	> Spain will promote the creation of new 
links between Spanish and African busi-
ness schools and think tanks, in order to 
bolster, respectively, joint strategic analy-
ses and networks of African entrepreneurs 
and managers with a special connection to 
our country.

	> Spain will continue to develop coopera-
tion and twinning agreements between 
Spain’s Autonomous Communities and 
local authorities and their counterparts in 
African countries, paying special attention 
to the needs of cities in the present context 
of rapid urbanization within the continent.

	> We will continue to promote scientific 
cooperation on fishing, in areas such as 
creating programmes to place scientific 
observers on board vessels, fostering co-
llaboration between scientific institutes in 
Spain and the respective third countries 
and actively participating in the Fishery 
Committee for the Eastern Central Atlan-
tic (CECAF). Greater cooperation could also 
be achieved via delegated cooperation pro-
jects, which might also finance oceanogra-
phic campaigns.

Meeting of African-Spanish Hispanists at Casa África 
in 2019.
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3.3. A strong stance against 
racism and xenophobia

	> Aware that racism and xenophobia are 
scourges that continue to threaten pea-
ceful coexistence, Spain will strengthen 
measures to combat prejudice in the edu-
cational field and in public discourse. In-
citement to hatred on the basis of race or 
nationality will be firmly pursued, using 
and refining the instruments available 
under Spanish law.

	> To combat hate speech and to develop 
counter-narrative strategies, OBERAXE 
will continue to analyse hate speech.

	> Spain will step up implementation of its 
Strategic Framework for Civic Responsibi-
lity and Inclusion, against Racism and Xe-
nophobia (2023–2027), seeking to achieve 
a cohesive, inclusive and diverse society 
and will continue to implement aware-
ness-raising programmes, together with 
training in the educational environment, 
in areas such as analysis of hate speech 
and the resources available to the public 
to combat it.

	> Dialogue will be promoted with mi-
grants—from North Africa, from Sub-Sa-
haran Africa, those of African descent and 
those from elsewhere—and discussions 
will be held within appropriate forums on 
how to combat racism and xenophobia.

	> Spain will promote training and aware-
ness-raising projects on the structural 
causes of racism, as it does in Latin Ame-
rica with the Afro-descendants Program-
me, run by AECID in collaboration with 
the Ministry of Equality.

3.4. Increase reliable, verified 
information to combat 
disinformation

	> Spain will reinforce its strategic commu-
nications to better convey its commitment 
to Africa and to reach public opinion in the 
continent, making greater use of digital 
diplomacy, in line with young Africans’ 
preference for social networks as their 
main source of information.

	> Frequent, productive contacts among 
journalists, analysts and experts from 
both sides will continue to be promoted, 
exploring ways to improve the channels 
through which information circulates. A 
greater presence in Africa of Spanish me-
dia, both public (RTVE, Agencia EFE) and 
private, will also be encouraged.

	> In collaboration with our Embassies, fur-
ther initiatives will be undertaken to sup-
port African countries in addressing the 
challenges of disinformation and infor-
mation manipulation.

3.5. Increase opportunities 
to learn and use the Spanish 
language in Africa

	> Spain will maintain its strategic com-
mitment to the dissemination of our lan-
guage in Africa, in all its dimensions: di-
plomatic, economic, cultural, scientific and 
educational. The presence of the Instituto 
Cervantes will be expanded, with more as-
sistantships organized by the Foreign Mi-
nistry and AECID at African universities. 
The ASALE study grant programme will be 
provided with more resources, and the pos-
sibilities offered by distance learning using 
digital tools will be fully exploited. The 
Spanish language will also be promoted in 
collaboration with the institutions from
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Latin American countries that are present 
in Africa.

	> Training for African students will be pro-
moted through the teaching of Spanish as 
a foreign language, as a resource for per-
sonal and professional development.

	> Capacity-building will be promoted for 
teachers of Spanish as a foreign language 
in African education systems. The Acade-
mic Missions, organized jointly by AECID 
and Instituto Cervantes within the ACER-
CA programme to train teachers of Spa-
nish as a foreign language, will be exten-
ded to visit more countries within Africa. 

	> Further support will be given to establish 
assistantships and to provide other forms 
of support to teachers and departments 
that teach Spanish in secondary schools 
and universities, with a specific focus on 
countries in West Africa and North Africa.

	> Spain will continue to support the use 
of Spanish in the AU and in subregional 
organizations such as ECOWAS by stren-
gthening and expanding existing agre-
ements. This support will be extended, 
firstly, to ECCAS, which has Spanish as 
one of its official languages.

3.6. Strengthen our cooperation 
through culture and sport to 
drive development and inclusion

	> Spain will strengthen its cultural diplo-
macy programmes and activities in Afri-
ca, providing them with greater flexibility 
and expanding their technical and finan-
cial resources. Contacts and collabora-
tions between Spanish and African cultural 
stakeholders will be promoted and creative 
industries in Africa will be supported, with 
particular emphasis, again, on creating 
opportunities for young people. The expe-

rience gained from successful programmes 
will shared with other countries and cul-
tural agents.

	> Within UNESCO, Spain will work with its 
African partners to broaden the recogni-
tion of cultural and natural properties and 
sites in Africa that form part of the heri-
tage of humanity.

	> Efforts to promote Spanish culture will be 
intensified through the network of embas-
sies and cultural centres. Initiatives and 
campaigns will be developed to highlight 
Spain’s past, thereby improving mutual 
appreciation of significant historical figu-
res of Spanish origin and supporting the 
work of African Hispanists. Activities such 
as the Hola Bamako festival will also con-
tinue to be fostered.

	> Mindful of the great contribution of sport 
to social inclusion, Spain will extend its co-
llaboration in sports matters with Africa, 
supporting cooperation and training initia-
tives undertaken by Spanish associations 
and clubs with their African counterparts. 

4.
PROTECTING

Strategic goal: cooperate to strengthen ca-
pacities in justice and security

4.1 Increase our support 
for African States’ and 
organizations’ peacekeeping and 
security responsibilities

	> Spain will respond to its regional part-
ners’ requests for cooperation in security 
and defence through capacity-building, 
provision of equipment and intelligence 



78

cooperation and through bilateral instru-
ments such as cooperative security opera-
tions. It will also avail of the possibilities 
offered by the renewed common security 
and defence policy of the EU, with tools 
such as the European Peace Facility, EU-
AU cooperation, the Security and Defence 
Initiative in support of West African cou-
ntries of the Gulf of Guinea and the EU’s 
civil and military missions in Africa. In 
addition, it will use security-enhancing 
instruments such as the 5+5 Defence Ini-
tiative, which encourage cooperation ba-
sed on trust amongst equals.

	> Spain’s security cooperation with Africa 
will be increasingly meshed within the 
African Peace and Security Architecture, 
in line with our belief that it is the gover-
nments and organizations of the conti-
nent that must determine their priorities, 
setting objectives and drawing up appro-
priate peace and security strategies, thus 
ensuring full ownership by the beneficiary 
societies of multilateral efforts in this 
field. Spain will support a new generation 
of peacekeeping missions, more sustaina-
ble and effective, led by the African Union 
and other organizations on the continent 
and co-funded by the international com-
munity, including contributions to the 
United Nations regular budget.

	> With respect to maritime security, Spain 
remains firmly committed to the Yaoun-
dé Architecture for maritime security in 
the Gulf of Guinea, through programmes 
such as the EU Coordinated Maritime Pre-
sences. With our African and European 
partners, efforts to combat piracy will be 
continued with missions such as ATA-
LANTA, deployed off the coast of Somalia, 
to which from the outset Spain’s navy has 
made a significant contribution, achieving 
very positive results.

	> Spain’s collaboration with African part-
ners, especially those in West Africa and 
the Maghreb, will also be strengthened 
through the navy’s periodic African De-
ployments, with respect to maritime sur-
veillance and rescue, the prevention and 
combating of pollution, supporting the 
creation of green shipping corridors to 
raise environmental standards, and ad-
vancing towards decarbonization of ma-
ritime transport.

	> In West Africa, Spain will support subre-
gional security training initiatives such as 
the International Academy for the Fight 
Against Terrorism in Jacqueville (Côte 
d’Ivoire), the Kofi Annan International 
Peacekeeping Training Centre in Accra 
(Ghana) and the G5 Sahel Defence College 
of Nouakchott (Mauritania).

	> Within the NATO framework, Spain will 
promote the follow-up to the conclusions 
of the Madrid Summit of June 2022 and 
will support the deepening and intensi-
fication of dialogue and cooperation with 
the Southern Neighbourhood, with ins-
truments already available to Spain and 
its allies. One such resource is the Defen-
ce and Related Security Capacity Building 
(DCB) Initiative, which provides training 
and advice on strengthening national se-
curity architectures to Mediterranean Dia-
logue countries. Spain will also promote 
the consistent application of the Alliance’s 
action plan for the Southern Neighbour-
hood and will provide support to the Se-
cretary General’s new Special Representa-
tive for the Southern Neighbourhood. 

	> Spain will intensify its bilateral defence 
cooperation relations through program-
mes to build and strengthen military ca-
pabilities, and by extending its network of 
defence attachés and advisors in strategic 
countries and areas of Africa.
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4.2 Greater Spanish involvement 
in conflict prevention and 
resolution in Africa

	> Spain will continue to advocate the use of 
diplomatic tools for conflict prevention and 
resolution, such as good offices or media-
tion, and will put its experience and infras-
tructure in this area, such as the Toledo In-
ternational Center for Peace, at the disposal 
of its African partners. Spain will study the 
creation of new instruments to support the 
prevention and resolution of conflicts in 
Africa, without prejudice to its contribution 
to initiatives undertaken by regional and 
global multilateral organizations, especially 
the United Nations. 

	> Spain will also continue to promote 
the women, peace and security agenda 
through programmes and collaborations 
with its partners in all spheres—local, re-
gional (such as ECOWAS) and internatio-
nal, and also with civil society—and will 
work to limit the harmful effects of armed 
conflicts on the most vulnerable popula-
tions.

	> Spain will support gender mainstreaming 
in peace processes, and women’s partici-
pation in those processes. Specifically, in 
collaboration with the Special Represen-
tative of the Secretary-General on Sexual 
Violence in Conflict, Spain will promo-
te political dialogue to ensure that tho-
se responsible for conflict-related sexual 
violence are held accountable. 

	> In a comprehensive outlook on security, 
we must recognize the fragility of post-
conflict areas. In this respect, Spain will 
support reconstruction projects in areas 
affected by conflict, and disarmament, 
demobilization and reintegration initiati-
ves, to underpin stability and prevent re-
lapses into violence.

	> Partnerships with major humanitarian 
agencies, UNDP and other international 
organizations will be supported to stren-
gthen the peace dimension in the triple 
nexus approach and to promote the buil-
ding of peaceful societies.

	> One of the most serious violations of hu-
man rights against children in Africa is 
that of forced conscription by the par-
ties to conflicts in the continent. Spain 
has made an extraordinary contribution 
to the Trust Fund for Victims at the In-
ternational Criminal Court, so that all 
the former child soldiers conscripted and 
enlisted by the Congolese military offi-
cer Thomas Lubanga can receive the ne-
cessary reparations and reintegrate into 
their societies. We will continue to work 
to ensure these reparations are made and 
that the former child soldiers are demo-
bilized and fully reintegrated.

4.3 Strengthen our collaboration 
against terrorism, radicalization, 
organized crime and trafficking

	> Spain will continue to support African Sta-
tes in combating terrorism and other se-
rious crimes, not only instances and their 
effects, but also their root causes, such as 
the despair, often caused by a lack of eco-
nomic and life opportunities, by educatio-
nal deficiencies and incomplete or mani-
pulated information.

	> Spain will endeavour to play a more pro-
minent role in managing security-related 
aspects of delegated cooperation projects, 
as is already the case with initiatives such 
as CT Public Spaces and other security and 
justice projects under way on the conti-
nent. Spain will thus continue to provide 
its African neighbours with knowledge and 
know-how resulting from its experience 
in counter-terrorism and other areas such 
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as maritime security and combating or-
ganized crime, disinformation and hybrid 
threats. Furthermore, the Spanish Armed 
Forces will carry out bilateral cooperati-
ve security operations with African coun-
tries to build their capacities and improve 
procedures, enabling them to successfully 
address threats in the above-mentioned 
spheres.

4.4 Increase the Spanish contri-
bution to building African resi-
lience against climate and envi-
ronmental threats

	> Spain will work to raise awareness to pre-
vent and combat environmental crimes, 
sharing information and cooperating with 
our African partners in this area. A net-
work to combat environmental crimes in 
Africa will be promoted, modelled on the 
one with countries in Latin America (the 
Jaguar Network).

	> In addition, a partnership for climate resi-
lience will be established with African cou-

ntries, developing a network of observa-
tories and early warning mechanisms and 
improving response capacities. IDRA will 
be strengthened in Africa. This initiative is 
co-headed by Spain and Senegal, and sup-
ported by the United Nations Convention to 
Combat Desertification, and from contri-
butions to multilateral organizations that 
play a prominent role in Africa in addres-
sing climate change.

4.5 Strengthen Spanish 
Cooperation to defend 
sustainable development and 
address the structural causes of 
insecurity

	> Spain is committed to a comprehensive, 
positive concept of security, addressing 
not only people’s physical integrity but 
also their protection in situations of vul-
nerability, the guarantee of essential rights 
and the provision of basic services such as 
nutrition, education and health. Therefo-
re, we will continue to work with Africa to 
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address the structural causes of insecurity, 
with a comprehensive approach that pur-
sues inclusive and balanced economic de-
velopment, fair distribution of wealth and 
environmental sustainability.

	> In accordance with the mandate origi-
nating from the GSSDC Act, the Spanish 
Cooperation Master Plan (2024-2027) 
pays special attention to West Africa, the 
Sahel and North Africa.

5.
LIVING TOGETHER

Strategic goal: open African societies with 
strong, inclusive institutions 

5.1 Greater Spanish contribution 
to democratic consolidation, the 
rule of law and human rights in 
Africa

	> Encouraged by the broad social support 
for democracy in Africa, Spain will pro-
mote the sharing of knowledge and expe-
riences in the field of institutional reform 
and strengthening, to favour the develop-
ment of participatory democratic systems.

	> Spanish Cooperation will provide support 
to strengthen democratic governance and 
decentralization processes, with initiati-
ves such as the Global Covenant of Mayors 
for Climate and Energy, the PASCAL Pro-
ject, and projects to support accountabi-
lity, the rule of law and the fight against 
corruption, such as the Accountability, 
Rule of Law and Anti-Corruption Pro-
gramme (ARAP) in Ghana. The regional 
cooperation strategy for the Arab World 
(Masar Al’an/ Masar Ahora) presented in 
May 2024 will be implemented.

	> Spain will maintain the mechanisms to 
support and strengthen civil society orga-
nizations in Africa, their effective parti-
cipation in processes of change and de-
velopment and their links with Spanish 
counterparts. Particular support will be 
given to initiatives to promote women’s 
full, equal, meaningful and safe partici-
pation in politics, as well as that of histo-
rically marginalized groups.

	> In coordination with our European part-
ners, based on transparency, commitment 
and dialogue, and in partnership with 
African civil society, and seeking greater 
collaboration with the African countries 
that are most advanced in these matters, 
Spain will support initiatives in favour of 
diversity and against all forms of discri-
mination, especially on the grounds of se-
xual orientation and gender identity.

	> In the conviction that human rights are 
part of humanity’s common heritage, and 
that Europeans and Africans have endea-
voured to achieve recognition of and res-
pect for human rights, Spain will remain 
firmly committed to defending and pro-
moting fundamental rights and freedoms, 
and will work bilaterally and through 
multilateral mechanisms to remove the 
obstacles to their full enjoyment, paying 
particular attention to the rights of the 
most vulnerable people.

	> Although some progress has been made, 
the death penalty remains legal in almost 
two-thirds of the continent, although 
there are only a few countries in which it 
is actually practiced. Spain will continue 
to lead international efforts to achieve 
abolition of the death penalty across Afri-
ca, doing so both through bilateral chan-
nels, and through support for the Inter-
national Commission against the Death 
Penalty (ICDP).
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5.2 Strengthen Spanish support 
in the fight for equality of 
African women 

	> Through dialogue with our African part-
ners and in alliance with African women, 
Spain will continue to develop and imple-
ment its feminist foreign policy, guided 
by the objective of achieving full equality 
between men and women and the em-
powerment of women and girls, both in 
Africa and in the rest of the world. To this 
end, links will be strengthened between 
women’s groups and associations in Spain 
and Africa.

	> Spain will work with its African partners 
on initiatives to promote and protect the 
rights of women and girls, including their 
political participation at the highest level, 
within the multilateral context.

	> Spain will reaffirm its commitment to the 
political, economic and social empower-
ment of women and the eradication of 
all forms of violence against women and 
girls, especially sexual and gender-based 
violence, including that facilitated by te-
chnology, whether online or offline, and 
will strengthen cooperation programmes 
in these areas with African organizations 
such as AUDA-NEPAD and international 
ones such as UNFPA and UN-Women.

	> Spain will also strengthen programmes 
and projects related to the sexual and re-
productive rights of African women and 
girls, facilitating their access to sexual and 
reproductive health services. To achieve 
these objectives it will collaborate with 
relevant local, regional and international 
organizations, such as UN-Women and 
UNFPA, in addition to civil society, femi-
nist and grassroots organizations working 
in this area.

	> Specific actions will be pursued to sup-
port international and African civil society 
organizations working to combat female 
genital mutilation, early forced and child 
marriage, and other practices that viola-
te the human rights of women and girls. 
Thematic AECID initiatives for women 
leaders such as the Ellas+ and Raisa pro-
grammes will be strengthened.

	> Spain will contribute to enhancing African 
public systems via the exchange of public 
talent between institutions, seeking to 
build equal, inclusive societies, in colla-
boration with FIIAPP and the Ministry of 
Equality.
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Monitoring  
and evaluation

The implementation of this Strategy will 
be monitored through the relevant coordi-
nation mechanisms, especially the inter-
ministerial committee for Africa, in order to 
assure the alignment of the measures adop-
ted. The committee will meet twice yearly at 
ministerial level, chaired by the Minister of 
Foreign Affairs, European Union and Coope-
ration. It will also meet quarterly at the state 
secretary level, chaired by the State Secre-
tary for Foreign and Global Affairs.

Each year, the Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
will request information from the Spanish 
Embassies in African countries on progress 
on the lines of action set out in this Strategy, 
primarily through the Directorate-General 
for Africa and, in the countries in its remit, 
the Directorate-General for the Maghreb, 
the Mediterranean and the Middle East. In 
the area of Spain’s contribution to the EU’s 
Africa policy, this information will be 

provided by the Permanent Representation 
of Spain to the European Union.

A three-yearly evaluation report will be re-
quested from the Public Policy Evaluation 
Institute, in keeping with past strategic 
planning exercises.

6
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Appendix.  
Summary of 5 objectives and
100 lines of action
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OBJECTIVE 1

Strengthening
1.1 	Increase our high-level interaction with 
African partners, especially with West Africa 
and North Africa

1		  Hold more high-level meetings with 
African countries 

2		  Arrange more frequent meetings 
between Spanish and African authorities

3 		  Ensure a high-level presence at the 
inaugurations of African leaders

4 	  Increase the number of countries with 
which political consultations are held

1.2 Strengthen dialogue and collaboration 
with the AU and with other regional 
organizations, in particular with ECOWAS

5		  Maintain regular political dialogue with 
the AU and ECOWAS Commissions

6		  Collaborate with AUDA-NEPAD

7		  Organize the exchange of officials for 
short stays 

1.3 A bigger, more dynamic role for Spain in 
EU-African relations 

8		  Foster implementation of EU-AU 
commitments and seek EU-Africa 
coordination in multilateral forums

9		  Work with African partners to improve 
the identification and implementation 
of projects that are eligible for EU 
funding through mechanisms such 
as NDICI, International Partnerships, 
Global Gateway and TEIs

10		  Increase the proportion of African 
content in dialogue between Spain, the 
European Commission and the High 
Representative for Foreign Affairs and 
Security

11		  Incorporate Spanish position documents 
on Africa and Spanish representatives 
in European External Action Service 
(EEAS) and EU Delegations

12		  Foster Europe-Africa-Ibero America 
and Europe-Africa-Arab World 
triangulation

1.4 Strengthen our inter-ministerial and 
inter-territorial coordination of policies with 
Africa

13		  Establish an inter-ministerial 
committee for Africa

14		  Schedule ministerial trips and visits, as 
proposed by the Foreign Ministry

1.5 Greater guidance and training on the 
complexity of African affairs

15		  Create a new Africa advisory committee 
at the Foreign Ministry
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16		  Strengthen the role of the Africa Round 
Table

17		  Expand work with African diasporas

18		  Provide specific training on Africa at 
the Diplomatic School and engage in 
dialogue with counterparts

1.6  Enhance our diplomatic capabilities in 
Spain 

19		  Create a new Deputy Directorate-
General for West Africa and the Sahel 
within the Directorate-General for 
Africa

20		 Appoint focal points for African affairs 
at certain Spanish embassies in non-
African countries

1.7 Stronger presence on the ground 

21		  Open new embassies and establish 
new subsidiary diplomatic offices and 
sectoral offices, including Spanish 
Cooperation offices. Open new offices 
for the Spanish Embassy in Nigeria and 
reopen the Spanish Embassy in Libya. 

22 	Maintain a greater presence of 
Spanish Cooperation in the priority 
subregion of West Africa and the Sahel. 
Strengthen the Spanish Cooperation 
office in Senegal. Reopen the Spanish 
Cooperation office in Tunisia. Define a 
new strategy for cooperation in Africa.

OBJECTIVE 2

Growing
2.1 More training to help African youth find 
decent work

23		 Establish a new foundation to 
foster relations with Africa and to 
create academic and employment 
opportunities for young people through 
study grants and visitor programmes 

24		 Open new Spanish education and 
training centres in Africa 

25		 Support entrepreneurship programmes 
and the use of new technologies 

26		 Organize more study grants and 
programmes for students from Africa

27		 Recommence the Raisa visitor 
programme

28		 Facilitate access to decent work for 
people living in poverty

29		 Promote decent work and the social and 
solidarity economy
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2.2 Increase our contribution to Global 
Gateway projects in Africa

30		 Encourage companies to engage in 
projects in sectors where Spain plays a 
leading role

31		  Monitor Global Gateway projects in 
Africa through Spain’s embassies 

32		 Strengthen capacities relating to African 
and Global Gateway issues within the 
Permanent Representation of Spain to 
the EU

2.3 Strengthen financial support for Spanish 
investment in Africa

33		 Adapt FIEM and COFIDES to investment 
needs in Africa

34		 Introduce new financial packages for 
investment, especially in West Africa

35	 Ensure coordination and coherence 
among Spanish financial instruments

36		 Promote new public-private 
partnerships

37		 Implement and extend initiatives such 
as Alianza África Avanza”

38		 Continue the programme of visits with 
African businesses

2.4 Improve information and legal 
frameworks to facilitate investment

39		 Set up business forums and trade 
missions in the context of official visits

40		 Improve companies’ access 
to information on investment 
environments. Creation of an Ibero-
African association of chambers of 
commerce (AFRICO).

41		  Raise awareness of the Platform 
on Investment and Productive 
Transformation in Africa

42		 Promote regulatory harmonization and 
bilateral agreements

43		 Support the strengthening of OECD 
programmes with Africa

2.5 Greater Spanish involvement in new 
financing for development and debt relief for 
Africa

44		 Coordinate with Africa ahead of the 
Fourth International Summit on 
Financing for Development

45		 Collaborate with ECA to reform the 
global financial architecture

46		 Include contingency clauses in 
sovereign loans 

47		 Seek coordination between Spain and 
the AU at the G20

2.6 Increase Spain’s contribution to the 
development of transport, energy, water and 
digital infrastructure. Electrification

48	 	Participate in intra-African connectivity 
and digitalization

49	 	Invest more in connectivity between 
Spain and Africa

50	 	Participate in the electrification of 
Africa

51	  	Participate in the design and building of 
transport networks

52	 	Support the development of air and port 
navigation and satellite surveillance
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2.7 Greater Spanish involvement in the 
development of the tourism sector in Africa

53	  Prepare memorandums of 
understanding on cooperation and 
capacity-building in the tourism sector

54	 	Increase the presence of the African 
tourism sector on the UN Tourism 
agenda

55	  Greater presence of high-level officials 
at UN Tourism

56	  Support for tourism campaigns by 
African embassies in Spain

OBJECTIVE 3

Connecting          

3.1 Migration that is safer, and more orderly, 
regular and mutually beneficial

57		 Promote partnerships between countries 
of origin, transit and destination

58		 Strengthen the fight against irregular 
immigration and people smuggling, 
in close cooperation with countries of 
origin and transit. Prevent departures 
that endanger human lives, by 
supporting surveillance in third 
countries.

59		 Expand circular migration and Talent 
Partnerships

60		 Promote comprehensive migration 
management and create a country-team 
mechanism

61		  Improve consular services in Africa

3.2 Create more instruments to promote 
contact and mutual understanding 

62		 Create Council Foundations between 
Spain and African partners 

63		 Promote collaboration agreements 
between Spanish and African 
universities and research centres

64		 Strengthen the capacities of Casa África, 
Casa Árabe and Casa Mediterráneo

65	 Establish new links between business 
schools and think tanks

66		 Promote cooperation between regional 
and local authorities, especially cities

3.3 A stronger stance against racism and 
xenophobia

67		 Reinforce measures in the fields of 
education and public discourse

3.4 Increase reliable, verified information to 
combat disinformation

68		 Strengthen strategic communication 
and digital diplomacy, and combat 
disinformation

69		 Encourage contact between journalists 
in Spain and Africa and promote the 
dissemination of Spanish content on the 
continent
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3.5 Increase opportunities to learn and use 
the Spanish language in Africa

70		 Increase the number of study grants 

71		  Expand the presence of Instituto 
Cervantes in new countries (facilities in 
Angola) 

72		 Promote training for teachers of 
Spanish (ACERCA programme) 

73		 Promote language teaching 
assistantships and support where 
Spanish is taught

74		 Promote the use of Spanish in the AU 
and ECOWAS

3.6 Strengthen cooperation through culture 
and sport to drive development and inclusion

75		 Support exchanges with African creative 
industries

76	  Collaborate with UNESCO partners to 
recognize heritage of humanity in Africa

77		 Promote knowledge about shared 
aspects of our cultures

78	  Promote cooperation between sports 
organizations

79		 Expand the Hola Bamako festival”

OBJECTIVE 4

Protecting          
4.1 Increase our support for African States’ 
and organizations’ peacekeeping and 
security responsibilities

80		 Collaborate on security and defence, 
both bilateral and through EU 
instruments

81		  Support African initiatives and AU 
peacekeeping missions

82		 Participate in maritime security actions 
in West Africa and off the coast of 
Somalia

83		  Support counter-terrorist, 
peacekeeping and defence training 
centres in Africa

84 	 Promote further NATO dialogue 
and cooperation with the Southern 
Neighbourhood

4.2 Greater Spanish involvement in conflict 
prevention and resolution in Africa

85		 Support national and multilateral 
instruments for conflict prevention and 
peaceful resolution

86		 Support the women, peace and security 
agenda, in association with regional, 
international, local and civil society 
partners
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87		 Support post-conflict reconstruction 
and disarmament, and the 
demobilization and reintegration of 
child soldiers

4.3 Strengthen our collaboration against 
terrorism, radicalization, organized crime and 
trafficking

88		 Promote mutual support and 
collaboration in the prevention, 
prosecution and suppression of 
terrorism, radicalization, organized 
crime and trafficking, especially of 
drugs, arms and human beings

4.4 Increase the Spanish contribution to 
building African resilience against climate 
and environmental threats

89		 Cooperate against environmental crimes

90		 Promote partnerships for climate 
resilience

4.5 Strengthen Spanish Cooperation 
to defend sustainable development 
and address the structural causes of 
insecurity

91		 Cooperate on essential rights, nutrition, 
education and health

92		 Recognize West Africa, the Sahel and 
North Africa as subregional priorities in 
the Sixth Spanish Cooperation Master 
Plan 
 

OBJECTIVE 5

Living together        

5.1 Greater Spanish contribution to 
democratic consolidation, the rule of law and 
human rights in Africa

93		 Promote the sharing of knowledge and 
experiences on institutional reform and 
strengthening

94		 Support democratic governance, 
decentralization and the fight against 
corruption

95		 Support African civil society, especially 
marginalized groups

96		 Promote and support initiatives in 
favour of diversity in Africa

97		 Promote the bilateral and multilateral 
defence of human rights, with special 
attention to persons with disabilities

5.2 Strengthen Spanish support in the fight 
for equality of African women

98		 Support a feminist foreign policy and 
collaborate with women’s associations

99		 Cooperate with African organizations in 
empowering women and girls



100 Support actions to combat gender violence 
and promote women’s participation, including 
through programmes such as Ellas+ 
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